

Tabulation Sheet
RFP No. 15/16-01NS, Fresh Pizza & Delivery (High School)

Line Item	Description	Estimated Annual	JoJo's Pizza Kitchen	Pizza Hut		PJ of Southern Cali, Papa	
				Unit Price	Total Cost	Unit Price	Total Cost
Whole Pizza							
1	16" Cheese Pizza 8 Equal Slices	2,100	No Bid	\$ 7.10	\$ 14,910.00	\$ 6.98	\$ 14,658.00
2	16" Veggie Pizza 8 Equal Slices	2,200	No Bid	\$ 7.10	\$ 15,620.00	\$ 6.98	\$ 15,356.00
3	16" Pepperoni Pizza 8 Equal Slices	2,200	No Bid	\$ 7.10	\$ 15,620.00	\$ 6.98	\$ 15,356.00
4	Additional Toppings	NA	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	
Whole Pizza with Slices Individually Boxed							
5	16" Cheese Pizza 8 Equal Slices	2,400	No Bid	No Bid		\$ 10.80	\$ 25,920.00
6	16" Veggie Pizza 8 Equal Slices	3,500	No Bid	No Bid		\$ 10.80	\$ 37,800.00
7	16" Pepperoni Pizza 8 Equal Slices	2,700	No Bid	No Bid		\$ 10.80	\$ 29,160.00
8	Additional Toppings	NA	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	
Individual Whole Wheat Pizza Cut Into 4 Slices							
9	Individual Cheese Pizza 4 Slices	42,000	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	
10	Individual Veggie Pizza 4 Slices		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	
11	Individual Pepperoni Pizza 4 Slices		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	
12	Additional Toppings		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	