Bid 2021/22-3FA
Furniture and Equipment

Bid Matrix
. BIuesPace e BL{smess Culver-Newlin Demco, Inc GM Business Interiors Lakeshor‘e Learning McDowell- Craig itz &‘Ergonomlc EEE Comp?nent School Specialty, LLC .Slerra Szl Southv.vest ste il VIRCO, INC. Yamada Enterprises
Interiors Interiors Materials, LLC Solutions, Inc. Manufacturing Equipment Company Office Supply
rIRVINE UNIFIED

Line Brand / Series Category and/or

Iltem # Model # Description

Soft Seating, Single and
All Models Tandem Seating, Stools, No Bid 50.00% 55.00% No Bid 49.40% No Bid No Bid 57.00% No Bid 27.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Benches and Tables

Lounge: Lily, Sophie,
Shuttle

2 |All Styles & Models |All Models Task/Work Chairs No Bid 50.00% 55.00% No Bid 49.40% No Bid No Bid 57.00% No Bid 27.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Executive / Conference,

3 |All Styles &Models |All Models Guest and Side Chairs

No Bid 50.00% 55.00% No Bid 49.40% No Bid No Bid 57.00% No Bid 27.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Stacking and Nesting

4 |All Styles & Models [All Models Chairs and Stools

No Bid 50.00% 55.00% No Bid 49.40% No Bid No Bid 57.00% No Bid 27.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

9to5 SEATING . . . . . . . . .
5 OTHER: NON-SPECIFIED ITEMS No Bid 50.00% 55.00% No Bid 49.40% No Bid No Bid 57.00% No Bid 27.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Line . Category and/or .
ltem # Brand / Series Model # Description
6 All Paneling Systems NeBid NoBid NeBid NoBid NeBid NoBid NeBid NoBid NeBid NoBid NeBid NoBid NeBid NoBid

ABM OFFICE SOLUTIONS
OTHER: NON-SPECIFIED ITEMS

Line . Category and/or .
ltem # Brand/ Series Model # Description
8 Folding Tables (Mobile), Stages, Risers & Accessories No Bid 35.00% No Bid 8.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid 51.00% No Bid 28.00% No Bid 30.00% No Bid No Bid
AMTAB . . . . . . . . .
9 . No Bid 35.00% No Bid 8.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid 51.00% No Bid 28.00% No Bid 30.00% No Bid No Bid
Other: Non-Specified Items

| tli:‘e# Brand / Series Cateat;:jye:il;d/or Description
10 |Aloft No Bid 60.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 62.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
11 |Calibrate All Models Dei‘:ﬁl :Z:;T;“Ts a/b'l*:sight No Bid 60.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 62.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12 |Compete No Bid 60.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 62.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
13 OTHER: NON-APLCIFIED ITEMS No Bid 60.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid ,a?sngtiicrmeg%’:e No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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Bid 2021/22-3FA
Furniture and Equipment

Bid Matrix
. BIuesPace e BL{smess Culver-Newlin Demco, Inc GM Business Interiors Lakeshor‘e Learning McDowell- Craig itz &‘Ergonomlc EEE Comp?nent School Specialty, LLC .Slerra Szl Southv.vest ste il VIRCO, INC. Yamada Enterprises
Interiors Interiors Materials, LLC Solutions, Inc. Manufacturing Equipment Company Office Supply
rIRVINE UNIFIED

Line . Category and/or L
ltem # Brand / Series Model # Description
Lounge, Modular, Soft Seating, Single and
14 Bench Seating,  |All Models Tandem Seating, Stools, No Bid 40.00% No Bid No Bid 46.10% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 32.00% No Bid No Bid 10.00%
Stools, Executive, Benches and Tables
Guest & Conference
Seating
15 and Tables: All  |All Models Children Furniture No Bid 40.00% No Bid No Bid 46.10% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 32.00% No Bid No Bid 10.00%
Styles
ARCADIA CONTRACT . . . . " . . . . .
16 OTHER: NON-SPECIFIED ITEMS No Bid 40.00% No Bid No Bid 46.10% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 32.00% No Bid No Bid 10.00%
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®
o
i/IRVINE UNIFIED
SCHOOL DISTRICT

Bluespace
Interiors

Core Business
Interiors

Culver-Newlin

Demco, Inc

Bid 2021/22-3FA
Furniture and Equipment

GM Business Interiors

Bid Matrix

Lakeshore Learning
Materials, LLC

McDowell- Craig

Office & Ergonomic
Solutions, Inc.

Seating Component
Manufacturing

School Specialty, LLC

Sierra School
Equipment Company

Southwest School &
Office Supply

VIRCO, INC.

Yamada Enterprises

Line . Category and/or .
ltem # Brand / Series Model # Description
Scating: POV 418. | stacking: FLOT, Four leg
17 Model: AS4L06 chair, Four leg Caster No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 42.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
AS4L.., AS4C.., ASCL., Chair & Cantilever Chair
18 :::;':I_g: Acsa:;TSt“' Four leg café stool NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 42.00% No Bid No Bid NoBid No Bid NoBid No Bid
Seating: Poly Task
19 Chair and Stool, Task chair and stool with No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 42.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Alphabet Series Swivel glides or casters
Model: ASTA18 &
Student Desk Student desk with full
20 Model: ASWAS6, metal book box and No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 42.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ASWA)J permatuff edge
21 Arise Podium No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 42.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Model: ATPA1
Rectangle, Square, Round,
22 Shape Tables Pyramid, Taper and No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 42.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Teardrop
Soft Seating: Lounge
Model: ASMOV, MOV stool, Bloc, STP EXP . . . . . . . . . . . . .
23 ABLOC, ASTP, AEXP, |and NEB No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 42.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ANEB
Seating: Poly 4-Leg . .
Chair, Cantilever Staslflng. Sled base f:halr
Chair (18); four leg stacking
24 Model: DOOA, D10 chair; task chair; stacking No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 42.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
) ™ |cantilever chair; gas lift
DP9A, N .
. swivel chair & stool
D Series
Shape Student Desks Expanse, Aperture
25 Model: DST-RC...., Relztan ie P ’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 42.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
DST-EX..., DST-AP.... s
Discover Series
3P-120, Aperture,
26 Shape Tables Expanse, Gravity, Nebula, No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 42.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Nova, Rectangle, Teardrop
27 Café Tables Café tables with bases No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 42.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
28 T-LegFlipTopand | Nesting tables with locking No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 42.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Fixed Tables casters
29 Student Desk Student desk with book No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 42.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Model: R90D box
Uniflex Series
30 Activity Tables Horseshoe, rectangular, No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 42.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
half round and trapezoid
31 OTHER: I\?g;-ch-EBCEIII-:II-ED ITEMS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 42.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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IRVINE UNIFIED
SCHOOL DISTRICT

Bluespace
Interiors

Core Business
Interiors

Culver-Newlin

Demco, Inc

GM Business Interiors

Bid 2021/22-3FA

Furniture and Equipment

Bid Matrix

Lakeshore Learning
Materials, LLC

McDowell- Craig

Office & Ergonomic
Solutions, Inc.

Seating Component
Manufacturing

School Specialty, LLC

Sierra School
Equipment Company

Southwest School &
Office Supply

VIRCO, INC.

Yamada Enterprises

Other: Non-Specified Items

Line . Category and/or .
ltem # Brand / Series Model # Description
32 All Paneling Systems No Bid No Bid 25.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Artopex . . . . . . . . . . . . .
33 No Bid No Bid 25.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

OTHER: NON-SPECIFIED ITEMS

Line . Category and/or L
ltem # Brand / Series Model # Description
34 All Styles & Models No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 15.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
35 CARPET FORKIDS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 15.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Line . Category and/or L
ltem # Brand / Series Model # Description
Porcelain, Melamine,
36 Markerboards Graphic Board, Aluminum 43.10% 40.00% No Bid No Bid 36.60% No Bid No Bid 42.50% No Bid No Bid No Bid 20.00% No Bid No Bid
Frame
37 Glass Markerboards |Glass writing surfaces 43.10% 40.00% No Bid No Bid 36.60% No Bid No Bid 42.50% No Bid No Bid No Bid 20.00% No Bid No Bid
Claridge Cor, Fabricork,
38 Tackboards Designer Fabric, Tan 43.10% 40.00% No Bid No Bid 36.60% No Bid No Bid 42.50% No Bid No Bid No Bid 20.00% No Bid No Bid
Nucor, Aluminum & Wood
Frames
39 Mobile Boards& - |Porcelain and Tackable 43.10% 40.00% No Bid No Bid 36.60% No Bid No Bid 42.50% No Bid No Bid No Bid 20.00% No Bid No Bid
Easels surfaces
Freestanding, Wall Mount
40 Displays & Trophy  |and Recessed Cases. 43.10% 40.00% No Bid No Bid 36.60% No Bid No Bid 42.50% No Bid No Bid No Bid 20.00% No Bid No Bid
Cases Aluminum & Wood
Frames:; [lluminated or
CLARIDGE PRODUCTS . . . . . . . . .
41 OTHER: NON-SPECIFIED ITEMS 43.10% 40.00% No Bid No Bid 36.60% No Bid No Bid 42.50% No Bid No Bid No Bid 10.00% No Bid No Bid
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Bid 2021/22-3FA
Furniture and Equipment

Bid Matrix
. BIuesPace e BL{smess Culver-Newlin Demco, Inc GM Business Interiors Lakeshor‘e Learning McDowell- Craig itz &‘Ergonomlc EEE Comp?nent School Specialty, LLC .Slerra Szl Southv.vest ste il VIRCO, INC. Yamada Enterprises
Interiors Interiors Materials, LLC Solutions, Inc. Manufacturing Equipment Company Office Supply
rIRVINE UNIFIED

I tI;i:‘e# Brand / Series Cateﬁ&;;y;;d/or Description
42 Culinary :It:;(’;'e;: j(t:es'; alel':z 37.00% 45.00% No Bid No Bid 48.00% No Bid No Bid 41.50% No Bid 42.00% 28.50% No Bid No Bid No Bid
43 Art & Drafting Tables 37.00% 45.00% No Bid No Bid 48.00% No Bid No Bid 41.50% No Bid 42.00% 28.50% No Bid No Bid No Bid
44 Robotics, 37.00% 45.00% No Bid No Bid 48.00% No Bid No Bid 41.50% No Bid 42.00% 28.50% No Bid No Bid No Bid

Storage Cabinets

Metal & Steel Frame,
45 All Seating Stools Hardwood Seat, Tempered 37.00% 45.00% No Bid No Bid 48.00% No Bid No Bid 41.50% No Bid 42.00% 33.50% No Bid No Bid No Bid
Masonite Panel Overlay

46 ‘:,:")‘l’)‘i’l‘:é:g?::;s & |Butcher Block 37.00% 45.00% No Bid No Bid 48.00% No Bid No Bid 41.50% No Bid 42,00% 28.50% NoBid No Bid No Bid

Science & Lab Chem-guard, Phenolic

47 Tables Resin, Epoxy Resin etc.

37.00% 45.00% No Bid No Bid 48.00% No Bid No Bid 41.50% No Bid 42.00% 33.50% No Bid No Bid No Bid

DIVERSIFIED WOODCRAFTS . . . . . . . .
48 OTHER: NON-SPECIFIED ITEMS 37.00% 45.00% No Bid No Bid 48.00% No Bid No Bid 41.50% No Bid 42.00% 24.50% No Bid No Bid No Bid

I tli:‘e# Brand / Series Cateﬁ&;;y;;d/or Description
49 ;::'t‘"f‘:"““”"e No Bid 30.00% 55.00% No Bid 39.90% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 25.00% No Bid 10.00%
50 g::;i;e""’e & Guest No Bid 30.00% 55.00% No Bid 39.90% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 25.00% No Bid 10.00%
51 21‘;';‘::"’“‘* No Bid 30.00% 55.00% No Bid 39.90% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 25.00% No Bid 10.00%
52 EcD&ﬁf&?ﬁ%ﬁ!gécc’:‘:f%‘;?;ssm” No Bid 30.00% 55.00% No Bid 39.90% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 25.00% No Bid 10.00%

Line . Category and/or .
ltem # Brand / Series Model # Description
53 Classroom furniture %‘L‘f::t')es"s"““ﬁ"”y No Bid No Bid No Bid 18.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid 28.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid 10.00% No Bid No Bid
54 ECR4KIDS No Bid No Bod No Bid 18.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid 28.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid 10.00% No Bid No Bid
OTHER: NON-SPECIFIED ITEMS 0 Bl |0 BOl 0 Bl A 0 Bl 0 Bl 0 Bl A 0 Bl 0 Bl 0 Bl A 0 Bl 0 Bl
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Bid 2021/22-3FA
Furniture and Equipment

Bid Matrix
. BIuesPace e BL{smess Culver-Newlin Demco, Inc GM Business Interiors Lakeshor‘e Learning McDowell- Craig itz &‘Ergonomlc EEE Comp?nent School Specialty, LLC .Slerra Szl Southv.vest ste il VIRCO, INC. Yamada Enterprises
Interiors Interiors Materials, LLC Solutions, Inc. Manufacturing Equipment Company Office Supply
rIRVINE UNIFIED

| tli:‘e# Brand / Series Cateat;:jye:il;d/or Description
55 SB::E:ES &Meodular No Bid 40.00% No Bid No Bid 51.60% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 39.25% No Bid No Bid 12.00%
56 g:;f::‘ Stackable No Bid 40.00% No Bid No Bid 51.60% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 39.25% No Bid No Bid 12.00%
57 'S'Z:{‘ii:& Modular No Bid 40.00% No Bid No Bid 51.60% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 39.25% No Bid No Bid 12.00%
58 OTEE‘?,\'}SS_;’;'E%?;S :‘ﬁMS No Bid 40.00% No Bid No Bid 51.60% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 39.25% No Bid No Bid 12.00%

Line . Category and/or .
ltem # Brand / Series Model # Description
59 |Le Fantome No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 50.90% No Bid No Bid 52.80% No Bid No Bid 32.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid
Office Desks,
60 |Universal Workstations, Lounge No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 50.90% No Bid No Bid 52.80% No Bid No Bid 32.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid
Seating
61 |Faustino’s No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 50.90% No Bid No Bid 52.80% No Bid No Bid 32.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid
62 OT:SAJ:SJ?,\?:::CT:IJS:?EMS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 50.90% No Bid No Bid 52.80% No Bid No Bid 32.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid

Line . Category and/or .
ltem # Brand / Series Model # Description

63 |Classroom All Styles & Models |Students Desks & Tables No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 29.10% No Bid No Bid 12.50% No Bid No Bid 10.00%

Designer 2.0, .
. . Storage Cabinets . . . . . . . . . . .

64 (Sheerline, lllusions  |All Styles & Models |;. . . No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 29.10% No Bid No Bid 2.00% No Bid No Bid 10.00%
20 (including mobile)
Specialty: Science, Science tables, stools,

65 |Makerspace,Stem& | ) 5pyos & Models  [VNiteboards units, mobile No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 29.10% No Bid No Bid 2.00% No Bid No Bid 10.00%
CTE, cabinets, instrument
Harmony Storage compartments

66 |Evoke All Styles & Models  [Student Seating No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 29.10% No Bid No Bid 12.50% No Bid No Bid 10.00%

67 OTIT-EERETI\\IAS?\I?SDPEgﬁ!\IIEIEJI'?EMS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 29.10% No Bid No Bid 2.00% No Bid No Bid 10.00%
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IRVINE UNIFIED
SCHOOL DISTRICT

Bluespace
Interiors

Core Business
Interiors

Culver-Newlin

Demco, Inc

Furniture and Equipment

GM Business Interiors

Bid 2021/22-3FA

Bid Matrix

Lakeshore Learning
Materials, LLC

McDowell- Craig

Office & Ergonomic
Solutions, Inc.

Seating Component
Manufacturing

School Specialty, LLC

Sierra School
Equipment Company

Southwest School &
Office Supply

VIRCO, INC.

Yamada Enterprises

OTHER: NON-SPECIFIED ITEMS

Line . Category and/or s
ltem # Brand / Series Model # Description
68 ALL SEATING PRODUCTS (ALL SERIES) No Bid No Bid 45.20% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 41.00% No Bid No Bid 5.00%
FOMCORE . . . . . . . . . . .
69 No Bid No Bid 45.20% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 41.00% No Bid No Bid 5.00%

Line : Category and/or .
ltem # Brand / Series Model # Description

Lounge, Task, Executive, .

70 [Seating Al Styles & Models |Guest, Tandem, Benches 53.60% 52.00% No Bid No Bid 38.20% No Bid No Bid 46.60% No Bid Total ?_?::Zg;% oTG No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
etc.

71 |Desking. Tables& |\, o )00 g Models |WVorkstation, Paneling, 47.30% 52.00% No Bid No Bid 38.20% No Bid No Bid 46.60% No Bid 27.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Paneling Systems Office, Classrooms etc.

Filing Cabinets, Bookcases,

72 |Filing&Storage | All Styles &Models |Pedestals, Specialty 47.30% 52.00% No Bid No Bid 38.20% No Bid No Bid 46.60% No Bid 27.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Storage (including mobile)

GLOBAL FURNITURE GROUP ) ) ) ) ) Total Office 27% OTG ) ) ) )
73 OTHER, NON SPECIFIED 1TEMS 47.30% 52,00% No Bid No Bid 38.20% No Bid No Bid 46.60% No Bid e No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Line

Category and/or

OTHER: NON-SPECIFIED ITEMS

ltem # Brand / Series Model # Description
74 |Ethos Series All Styles & Models |l-in-One Seating Units No Bid 43.00% No Bid 11.00% 35.80% NoBid No Bid NoBid No Bid NoBid 37.00% 30.00% No Bid No Bid
with tablet arm and casters
HASKELL ) ) ) ) ) ) ) ) )
75 No Bid 43.00% No Bid 11.00% 35.80% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 37.00% 30.00% No Bid No Bid

OTHER: NON-SPECIFIED ITEMS

Line . Category and/or .
ltem # Brand / Series Model # Description
76 ALL SEATING PRODUCTS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Non-Responsive No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.00%
77 HERMAN MILLER No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Non-Responsive No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.00%

Bid No. 2021/22 - 3FA, Furniture Equipment - Bid Award 06.28.2022
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Bid 2021/22-3FA
Furniture and Equipment

Bid Matrix
. BIuesPace e Bt{smess Culver-Newlin Demco, Inc GM Business Interiors Lakeshor‘e Learning McDowell- Craig itz &‘Ergonomlc EEE Comp?nent School Specialty, LLC .Slerra Szl Southv.vest ste il VIRCO, INC. Yamada Enterprises
Interiors Interiors Materials, LLC Solutions, Inc. Manufacturing Equipment Company Office Supply
rIRVINE UNIFIED

Line . Category and/or s
ltem # Brand / Series Model # Description
Lounge seating, Task,
. Executive, Guest, . . . . . . .
78 |Seating All Styles & Models . N 56.90% No Bid No Bid No Bid 25.90% No Bid No Bid 57.90% No Bid 29.00% 40.00% 35.00% No Bid 1.00%
Collaborative, Stacking
etc.
Desking, Tables & Workstation, Paneling, Stations=54% . . . . . Panels 63.5% Tables & . .
79 Paneling Systems All Styles & Models Office, Multi-Purpose etc. Table/desk=47% No Bid No Bid No Bid 28.20% No Bid No Bid Desks 57.6% No Bid 29.00% 30.00% 35.00% No Bid 1.00%

Filing Cabinets, Bookcases,
80 |Filing & Storage All Styles & Models  |Pedestals, Specialty 49.50% No Bid No Bid No Bid 28.70% No Bid No Bid 57.90% No Bid 29.00% 30.00% 35.00% No Bid 1.00%
Storage (including mobile)

HON
OTHER: NON-SPECIFIED ITEMS

81 47.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid 25.90% No Bid No Bid 57.60% No Bid 29.00% 30.00% 35.00% No Bid 1.00%

Line
ltem #

Category and/or
Model #

Brand / Series Description

Seating: 50%

Side Seating: 44%
Ergo Tools: 57%

Ergo Seating=51% Lighting: 56%
PERCENTACE N AL L CATALOG ITEMS aaesshry 40.00% No Bid No Bid A begr s No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10.00%
Quickstand=38.5% Float/QS: 47%

Efloat: 56%
Efloat Go: 54%
Modesty: 35%

82

Line Category and/or

Brand / Series Description

ltem # Model #

83 ALL SEATING PRODUCTS 52.30% No Bid No Bid No Bid 55.50% No Bid No Bid 57.50% No Bid No Bid 50.00% No Bid No Bid 10.00%

84 IDEON 52.30% No Bid No Bid No Bid 55.50% No Bid No Bid 57.50% No Bid No Bid 50.00% No Bid No Bid 10.00%
OTHER: NON-SPECIFIED ITEMS - o Bl o Bi 0 Bi . o Bi o Bi ] o Bi o Bi ! 0 Bi 0 Bi ]

Line . Category and/or .
ltem # Brand / Series Model # Description
85 Lounge Seating 44.40% No Bid No Bid No Bid 22.20% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 30.00% No Bid No Bid 5.00%
86 gfth: nl‘sat:red 44.40% No Bid No Bid No Bid 22.20% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 30.00% No Bid No Bid 5.00%
Kl . " . . " . . . . .
87 OTHER: NON-SPECIFIED ITEMS 44.40% No Bid No Bid No Bid 22.20% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 15.00% No Bid No Bid 5.00%
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i/IRVINE UNIFIED
SCHOOL DISTRICT

Bluespace
Interiors

Core Business
Interiors

Culver-Newlin

Demco, Inc

Bid 2021/22-3FA
Furniture and Equipment

GM Business Interiors

Bid Matrix

Lakeshore Learning
Materials, LLC

McDowell- Craig

Office & Ergonomic
Solutions, Inc.

Seating Component
Manufacturing

School Specialty, LLC

Sierra School
Equipment Company

Southwest School &
Office Supply

VIRCO, INC.

Yamada Enterprises

Line . Category and/or L
ltem # Brand / Series Model # Description
Comfy Floor Seats,
88 |Flex-Space Classroom Furniture |Premium Wobble Chairs, No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 6.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Soft Seating
89 |Flex-Space Jr. Mobile Furniture and | Mobile Tables, Mobile No Bid NoBid No Bid NoBid No Bid 6.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Storage Storage, Mobile Nook
Storage Cubbies, Tabletop
90 |Classic Birch Classroom Furniture \Writing Center, Transition No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 6.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
and Storage Chairs, Storage Units,
Tables, Step Stool
Classroom Furniture Tables, Storage,
91 [HeavyDuty and Storage Bookstands, Cots, No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 6.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
8 Teaching Easels
92 |Kids Colors acr':f;g‘r’a";:”'"'ture Storage, Tables, Chairs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 6.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Classroom Furniture, |Carpets, Comfy Couch,
93 |JustLike Home Soft Seating and Comfy Chair, Tables, No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 6.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Classroom Carpets |Storage
Privacy Nook, Outdoor
94  |Outdoor Outdoor Furniture |Tables, Benches, Lounger, No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 6.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Storage, Cabana
Classroom Carpets |Classroom Carpets and . . . . . . . . . . . . .
95 . ) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 6.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
and Rugs Rugs, Multiple Sizes
96 LAKESHORE LEARNING No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 6.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

OTHER: NON-SPECIFIED ITEMS
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i/IRVINE UNIFIED
SCHOOL DISTRICT

Bluespace
Interiors

Core Business
Interiors

Culver-Newlin

Demco, Inc

Bid 2021/22-3FA
Furniture and Equipment

GM Business Interiors

Bid Matrix

Lakeshore Learning
Materials, LLC

McDowell- Craig

Office & Ergonomic
Solutions, Inc.

Seating Component
Manufacturing

School Specialty, LLC

Sierra School
Equipment Company

Southwest School &
Office Supply

VIRCO, INC.

Yamada Enterprises

OTHER: NON-SPECIFIED ITEMS

Line . Category and/or s
ltem # Brand / Series Model # Description
97 |Apex 56.40% No Bid 60.50% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
98 [Canyon 56.40% No Bid 60.50% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Office Desks,
Workstations,
Conference Tables
99 |[Gravity 56.40% No Bid 60.50% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
100 |Maverick 56.40% No Bid 60.50% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
101 MAVERICK OFFICE SOLUTIONS 56.40% No Bid 60.50% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

OTHER: NON-SPECIFIED ITEMS

Line . Category and/or L
ltem # Brand / Series Model # Description
All styles of student desk
102 Student Desk (includes with adjustable No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 55.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
height option)
Whiteboard and/or
103 Nesting Mobile Flip |laminate tops, adjustable No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 55.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tables height, locking casters,
with vertical lock option
104 Science Tables Science lab tables and No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 55.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
butcher block tables
Lateral & Vertical file Standard with lock file
105 " ) cabinets, adjustable shelf No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 45.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
cabinets; Bookcases
bookcases
Mobile Whiteboards; 0 2T O et
106 Tote Tray Carts with . p No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 55.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
magnetic markerboard,
markerboard back N
locking casters
107 McDOWELL-CRAIG No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 55.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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Bid 2021/22-3FA
Furniture and Equipment

Bid Matrix
. BIuesPace e Bt{smess Culver-Newlin Demco, Inc GM Business Interiors Lakeshor‘e Learning McDowell- Craig itz &‘Ergonomlc EEE Comp?nent School Specialty, LLC .Slerra Szl Southv.vest ste il VIRCO, INC. Yamada Enterprises
Interiors Interiors Materials, LLC Solutions, Inc. Manufacturing Equipment Company Office Supply
rIRVINE UNIFIED

Line . Category and/or s
ltem # Brand/ Series Model # Description
Marker
108 MOORECO Boards/Tackboards/Gla

PERCENTAGE ON ALL CATALOG ITEMS ss Boards 0%

Other item 5%

Line Category and/or

ltem # Brand / Series Model # Description
109 |Flex Lounge Seating No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 19.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid
110 |Chameleon Lounge Seating No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 19.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid

Storage, Straight &
111 |K10 Curved Bookcases, |Mobile No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 14.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bin Storage Cabinets

112 OTHER: NONI\-/ISIFEEICIFIED ITEMS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 14.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid

Line . Category and/or .
ltem # Brand / Series Model # Description
Tables 20%
113 MITY LITE Chairs 17%

PERCENTAGE ON ALL CATALOG ITEMS Carts 13%
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i/IRVINE UNIFIED
SCHOOL DISTRICT

Bluespace
Interiors

Core Business
Interiors

Culver-Newlin

Demco, Inc

Bid 2021/22-3FA
Furniture and Equipment

GM Business Interiors

Bid Matrix

Lakeshore Learning
Materials, LLC

McDowell- Craig

Office & Ergonomic
Solutions, Inc.

Seating Component
Manufacturing

School Specialty, LLC

Sierra School
Equipment Company

Southwest School &
Office Supply

VIRCO, INC.

Yamada Enterprises

OTHER: NON-SPECIFIED ITEMS

Line . Category and/or L
ltem # Brand / Series Model # Description
8’ Rectangular Portable
Rectangular Outdoor | Table, expanded metal,
114 Table diamond pattern with No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid List + 9.5% 5.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Model: TRT... matching frame and top
paint finish
Kinder height: 46" Round
Round Outdoor Portable Table, expanded
115 Table metal, diamond pattern No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid List + 9.5% 5.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Model: TRD46... with matching frame and
top paint finish
Commercial
Adult height: 46" Round
Round Outdoor Portable Table, expanded
116 Table metal, diamond pattern No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid List + 9.5% 5.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Model: TRD46... with matching frame and
top paint finish
sauare outdoor |0 lamond.
117 Table P . L No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid List + 9.5% 5.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
pattern with matching
Model: TSQ46... e
frame and top paint finish
118 MYTCOAT No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid List + 9.5% 5.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

OTHER: NON-SPECIFIED ITEMS

| tli:‘e# Brand / Series Cateat;:jye:il;d/or Description
119 Folding Chairs No Bid No Bid 50.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 39.60% No Bid 34.00% 40.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid
120 Folding Tables No Bid No Bid 50.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 39.60% No Bid 34.00% 40.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid
121 Music Chairs No Bid No Bid 50.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 39.60% No Bid 34.00% 40.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid
122 Transport Carts, No Bid No Bid 50.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 39.60% No Bid 34.00% 40.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid
Dollies & Racks
123 ::;’I‘sce & Industrial No Bid No Bid 50.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 39.60% No Bid 34.00% 40.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid
124 NATIONAL PUBLIC SEATING No Bid No Bid 50.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 39.60% No Bid 34.00% 40.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid
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IRVINE UNIFIED
SCHOOL DISTRICT

Bluespace
Interiors

Core Business
Interiors

Culver-Newlin

Demco, Inc

GM Business Interiors

Bid 2021/22-3FA

Furniture and Equipment

Bid Matrix

Lakeshore Learning
Materials, LLC

McDowell- Craig

Office & Ergonomic
Solutions, Inc.

Seating Component
Manufacturing

School Specialty, LLC

Sierra School
Equipment Company

Southwest School &
Office Supply

VIRCO, INC.

Yamada Enterprises

| tI;i:‘e# Brand / Series Catea&;;y;;d/or Description
125 |All Styles All Models Lounge & Wood Seating No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 43.10% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
126 |All Styles All Models Tables & Benches No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 43.10% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
127 |All Styles All Models g::z::s'a”"e Seating & No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 43.10% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
128 O%'Tcﬁfmgl ?E@Zl?ﬁéﬂm? No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 43.10% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Line . Category and/or .

ltem # Brand / Series Model # Description
129 AV Presentation Lecterns & Podiums No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 34.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
130 Tech Furniture z':rﬂ'e Storage & Charging No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 34.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
131 OTHE?Q:(I\I]gm?Sh;QCSICF)I%’;?TEMS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 34.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Line . Category and/or .
ltem # Brand / Series Model # Description
132 |Daisy, Hive Collaborative No Bid NoBid No Bid NoBid No Bid NoBid No Bid 21.10% No Bid No Bid 17.00% No Bid No Bid 5.00%
Lounge Seating
133 Shelving Bookcases &Book Truck No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 21.10% No Bid No Bid 10.00% No Bid No Bid 5.00%
PALMER HAMILTON . . . . . . . . . See attached discount . .
134 OTHER, NONCSPECIFIED ITEMS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 21.10% No Bid No Bid fached No Bid No Bid 5.00%

Line

Brand / Series

Category and/or

Description

Item # Model #
135 ALL BOARDS PRODUCT (ALL SERIES) No Bid No Bid 45.00% No Bid 43.40% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
136 O.T.::ENﬁng;lééﬁésDﬂ?;;S No Bid No Bid 45.00% No Bid 43.40% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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Line
Iltem #

Brand/ Series

Category and/or
Model #

IRVINE UNIFIED
SCHOOL DISTRICT

Description

137

SAFCO PRODUCTS
PERCENTAGE ON ALL CATALOG ITEMS

Bluespace
Interiors

Core Business
Interiors

Culver-Newlin

Demco, Inc

GM Business Interiors

Bid 2021/22-3FA

Furniture and Equipment

Bid Matrix

Lakeshore Learning
Materials, LLC

McDowell- Craig

Office & Ergonomic
Solutions, Inc.

Seating Component
Manufacturing

School Specialty, LLC

Sierra School
Equipment Company

Southwest School &
Office Supply

VIRCO, INC.

Yamada Enterprises

| tI;i:‘e# Brand / Series Cateat;:jye:il;d/or Description
138 |All Styles All Models Student Desks & Tables No Bid 53.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
139 |All Styles All Models All Seating No Bid 53.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
140 |All Styles All Models Collaborative Soft Seating No Bid 53.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
141 OS'I'CHHECI;L?Q%CNEQIEECF#FE’\IIDIT'IEJEES No Bid 53.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

OTHER: NON-SPECIFIED ITEMS

Line . Category and/or .

ltem # Brand / Series Model # Description
142 PORTABLE ROOM DIVIDERS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 30.90% No Bid No Bid 29.50% No Bid 18.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
143 SCREENFLEX PRODUCTS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 30.90% No Bid No Bid 29.50% No Bid 18.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Line

Brand / Series

Category and/or

Description

OTHER: NON-SPECIFIED ITEMS

Item # Model #
144 Outdoor Canvas Umbrellas & Bases (Including mobile) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 20.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
145 SEATING COMPONENTS UMBRELLA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 20.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Line

Brand/ Series

Category and/or

Description

Iltem # Model #
146 ALL CUSTOM OFFICE, CLASSROOM & SPECIALTY FURNITURE No Bid No Bid 56.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 32.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
147 g'll'sl-’l\‘EEls (;:\jso?\f:l;:é;;:gl;lé:fs No Bid No Bid 56.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 32.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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IRVINE UNIFIED
SCHOOL DISTRICT

Bluespace
Interiors

Core Business
Interiors

Bid 2021/22-3FA
Furniture and Equipment
Bid Matrix

Lakeshore Learning

GM Business Interiors Materials, LLC

Culver-Newlin Demco, Inc

McDowell- Craig

Office & Ergonomic
Solutions, Inc.

Seating Component
Manufacturing

School Specialty, LLC

Sierra School
Equipment Company

Southwest School &
Office Supply

VIRCO, INC.

Yamada Enterprises

Line . Category and/or s
ltem # Brand / Series Model # Description
148 |All Styles All Models Executive Chairs 52.30% No Bid No Bid No Bid 55.50% No Bid No Bid 57.50% No Bid No Bid 50.00% No Bid No Bid Non-Responsive
149 |All Styles All Models Task Chairs & Stools 52.30% No Bid No Bid No Bid 55.50% No Bid No Bid 57.50% No Bid No Bid 50.00% No Bid No Bid Non-Responsive
Guest Seating & . . . . . . . . . "
150 |All Styles All Models Conference 52.30% No Bid No Bid No Bid 55.50% No Bid No Bid 57.50% No Bid No Bid 50.00% No Bid No Bid Non-Responsive
151 0THERSILg’l\\II-I;P5:3-II;IIgI§ ITEMS 52.30% No Bid No Bid No Bid 55.50% No Bid No Bid 57.50% No Bid No Bid 50.00% No Bid No Bid Non-Responsive
Line . Category and/or .
ltem # Brand / Series Model # Description
Student desks, tables, . . . . . . . . . . . .
152 |Interchange casters No Bid No Bid 30.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.00%
. Student desks, tables, . . . . . . . . . . . .
153 |[Silhouette casters No Bid No Bid 30.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.00%
154 |Flex g:‘s’f:r:t desks, tables, No Bid No Bid 30.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.00%
All Models
Student desks, tables, . . . . . . . . . . . .
155 [UXL casters No Bid No Bid 30.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.00%
156 |Elemental g:‘s’f:r:t desks, tables, No Bid No Bid 30.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.00%
157 |Planner Student desks, tables, No Bid No Bid 30.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.00%
158 |All Styles & Models |All Seating No Bid No Bid 30.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.00%
159 |Cascade Storage Cabinets, Towers & No Bid No Bid 30.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.00%
Whiteboard Unit
160 Book Trucks No Bid No Bid 30.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.00%
161 OTHER: SNhg-ll:lt'SiYESC-II-IE::D ITEMS No Bid No Bid 30.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.00%
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Interiors
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Interiors
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I tI;i:‘e# Brand / Series Cateﬁ&;;y;;d/or Description
162 |Groupwork ﬂﬁﬁ::ﬁ :‘;’s‘:" & No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.00%
163 |Huddle board Whiteboard n‘;‘:::f;‘;:’r‘;& No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.00%
164 |Verb Whiteboard & Easel No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.00%
and Accessories
165 |Verb Tables No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.00%
166 |Alight Ottomans PNt Seating: Bench & No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid No Bid NoBid No Bid NoBid No Bid NoBid No Bid No Bid 1.00%
167 |Campfire Ottomans Soft Seating No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.00%
168 STEELCASE No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.00%

OTHER: NON-SPECIFIED ITEMS

| tli:‘e# Brand / Series Cateat;:jye:il;d/or Description
169 |All styles All Models Conference &Flips No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 52.60% No Bid No Bid 50.00% No Bid No Bid 10.00%
170 |All Styles All Models Benches & Power Bridge No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 52.60% No Bid No Bid 50.00% No Bid No Bid 10.00%
171 |All Styles All Models Sit/Stand Tables & Units No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 52.60% No Bid No Bid 50.00% No Bid No Bid 10.00%
172 SYMMETRY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 52.60% No Bid No Bid 50.00% No Bid No Bid 10.00%

OTHER: NON-SPECIFIED ITEMS

Line . Category and/or .
ltem # Brand / Series Model # Description

173 |New York NeBid NoBid NeBid NoBid NeBid NoBid NeBid NoBid NeBid NoBid NeBid NoBid NeBid NoBid
Office Desks & . . . . . . . . . . . . . .

174 |SOHO Workstations NeBid NoBid NeBid NoBid NeBid NoBid NeBid NoBid NeBid NoBid NeBid NoBid NeBid NoBid

175 |United NeBid NoBid NeBid NoBid NeBid NoBid NeBid NoBid NeBid NoBid NeBid NoBid NeBid NoBid

176 UNITED DESK B; Bi B; Bi B; Bi B; Bi No-Bi NoBi NoBi NoBi NoBi NoBi

OTHER: NON-SPECIFIED ITEMS
Bid No. 2021/22 - 3FA, Furniture Equipment - Bid Award 06.28.2022
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IRVINE UNIFIED
SCHOOL DISTRICT

Bluespace
Interiors

Core Business
Interiors

Bid 2021/22-3FA
Furniture and Equipment
Bid Matrix

Lakeshore Learning

GM Business Interiors Materials, LLC

Culver-Newlin Demco, Inc

McDowell- Craig

Office & Ergonomic
Solutions, Inc.

Seating Component
Manufacturing

School Specialty, LLC

Sierra School
Equipment Company

Southwest School &
Office Supply

VIRCO, INC.

Yamada Enterprises

I tI;i:‘e# Brand / Series Catea&;;y;;d/or Description
177 |All Styles All Models All Seating No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 53.60% No Bid
178 |All Styles All Models Desks & Tables No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 53.60% No Bid
179 |All Styles All Models Storage & Trucks No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 53.60% No Bid
180 VIRCO No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 53.60% No Bid
OTHER: NON-SPECIFIED ITEMS

Line : Category and/or .
ltem # Brand / Series Model # Description
31300, 31400, Compass, Cantilever, . . . . . . . . . . . . .
181 03825, 3428 & 3429 |Hokki Stools, Lupo No Bid No Bid 7.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Seating
PantoMove Lupo Star Base
182 31506 & 31507 & Star Base with No Bid No Bid 7.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Foot Ring
183 |All Styles All Models Zt:sdtf:; TD:;I'SS"’"" Tables, No Bid No Bid 7.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
184 [Shift+ Product All Models Soft Seating (Landscape), No Bid No Bid 7.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
book cases (mobile)
185 OTHER: ,\Yg,{?zgg(':mED ITEMS No Bid No Bid 7.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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12

IRVINE UNIFIED
SCHOOL DISTRICT

Bluespace
Interiors

Core Business
Interiors

Culver-Newlin

Demco, Inc

GM Business Interiors

Bid 2021/22-3FA
Furniture and Equipment
Bid Matrix

Lakeshore Learning
Materials, LLC

McDowell- Craig

Office & Ergonomic
Solutions, Inc.

Seating Component
Manufacturing

School Specialty, LLC

Sierra School
Equipment Company

Southwest School &
Office Supply

VIRCO, INC.

Yamada Enterprises

Line . Category and/or s
ltem # Brand/ Series Model # Description
8' Rectangular Portable
Rectangular Outdoor Table, expanded metal,
186 Table 8! diamond pattern with No Bid No Bid 4% No Bid Non-Responsive No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5.00% List + 56% No Bid No Bid No Bid
matching frame and top
paint finish
Kinder height: 46" Round
Round Outdoor Portable Table, expanded
187 Table metal, diamond pattern No Bid No Bid 4% No Bid Non-Responsive No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5.00% List + 56% No Bid No Bid No Bid
with matching frame and
top paint finish
Adult height: 46” Round
Round Outdoor Portable Table, expanded
188 Commercial Table metal, diamond pattern No Bid No Bid 4% No Bid Non-Responsive No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5.00% List + 56% No Bid No Bid No Bid
with matching frame and
top paint finish
46" Square Portable Table,
189 Square Outdoor  |expanded metal, diamond NoBid No Bid 2% No Bid Non-Responsive No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5.00% List + 56% NoBid No Bid No Bid
Table pattern with matching
frame and top paint finish
8’ or 10’ bench with or
without back, portable legs
190 Benches & or in-ground legs, 32 gal, NoBid No Bid 2% No Bid Non-Responsive No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5.00% List + 56% No Bid No Bid No Bid
Receptacles PVC Coated with dome
and line or flat top and
liner
191 WEBCOAT No Bid No Bid 4% No Bid Non-Re i No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5.00% List +56% No Bid No Bid No Bid
OTHER: NON-SPECIFIED ITEMS o Bi o Bi o Bi lon-Responsive o Bi o Bi o Bi o Bi i is o Bi o Bi o Bi
Line . Category and/or .
ltem # Brand / Series Model # Description
192 |Lobo No Bid No Bid No Bid 11.00% 54.30% No Bid No Bid 54.60% No Bid 46.00% 45.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tables: Butcher
Science & Lab Block, Phenolic, Stainless
Steel
193 |Toro No Bid No Bid No Bid 11.00% 54.30% No Bid No Bid 54.60% No Bid 46.00% 45.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid
194 |All Styles All Models Miobile - Music Storage No Bid No Bid NoBid 11.00% 54.30% No Bid No Bid 54.60% No Bid 46.00% 45.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid
195 |All Styles All Models Stools No Bid No Bid No Bid 11.00% 54.30% No Bid No Bid 54.60% No Bid 46.00% 45.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid
WISCONSIN BENCH MFG (WB MFG) . . " " " . See Attached Discount . . .
196 OTHER: NON-SPECIFIED ITEMS No Bid No Bid No Bid 11.00% 54.30% No Bid No Bid 54.60% No Bid 46.00% Structure No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid No. 2021/22 - 3FA, Furniture Equipment - Bid Award 06.28.2022
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o
i/IRVINE UNIFIED
SCHOOL DISTRICT

Bluespace
Interiors

Core Business
Interiors

Culver-Newlin

Demco, Inc

GM Business Interiors

Bid 2021/22-3FA

Furniture and Equipment

Bid Matrix

Lakeshore Learning
Materials, LLC

McDowell- Craig

Office & Ergonomic
Solutions, Inc.

Seating Component
Manufacturing

School Specialty, LLC

Sierra School
Equipment Company

Southwest School &
Office Supply

VIRCO, INC.

Yamada Enterprises

Line . Category and/or s
ltem # Brand / Series Model # Description
197 ALL CUSTOM OFFICE & SPECIALTY FURNITURE No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 42.80% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
198 0THV;IS?\IDCS#;:E§’;‘:;§T'IFEMS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 42.80% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bid No. 2021/22 - 3FA, Furniture Equipment - Bid Award 06.28.2022
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