
Tabulation Sheet

Category
Certified 

Transportation 
Services Inc.

First Student Inc.
JFK 

Transportation 
Co. Inc.

Lux Bus America 
Co.

Pacific Coachways

School Buses Min 5 Hrs/5+ Hrs Min 5 Hrs/5+ Hrs Min 5 Hrs/5+ Hrs Min 5 Hrs/5+ Hrs

72  $446.00/$78.00 $455.00/$65.00 $485.00/$81.00 No Bid

78  $456.00/$79.00 $455.00/$65.00 No Bid No Bid

84  $466.00/$80.00 No Bid $485.00/$81.00 No Bid

90  $486.00/$84.00 No Bid $590.00/$81.00 No Bid
School Buses 
w/Wheelchair Capacity

Min 5 Hrs/5+ Hrs Min 5 Hrs/5+ Hrs Min 5 Hrs/5+ Hrs Min 5 Hrs/5+ Hrs

72 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

78  $486.00/$84.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

84 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

72 $705.00 $455.00 $525.00 No Bid

78 $720.00 $455.00 No Bid No Bid

84 $735.00 No Bid $525.00 No Bid

90 $875.00 No Bid $600.00 No Bid

72 $436.00 $335.00 $285.00 No Bid

78 $446.00 $335.00 No Bid No Bid

84 $456.00 No Bid $300.00 No Bid

90 $486.00 No Bid $325.00 No Bid
SPAB Appvd Recliners 
w/Restroom

Min 5 Hrs/5+ Hrs Min 5 Hrs/5+ Hrs Min 5 Hrs/5+ Hrs Min 5 Hrs/5+ Hrs

25 $535.00/$88.00 No Bid No Bid $590.00/$105.00

47 $645.00/$112.00 No Bid No Bid $750.00/$120.00

55 $675.00/$118.00 No Bid No Bid $750.00/$120.00
SPAB Appvd Recliners 
w/Restroom & 
Wheelchair Capacity

Min 5 Hrs/5+ Hrs Min 5 Hrs/5+ Hrs Min 5 Hrs/5+ Hrs Min 5 Hrs/5+ Hrs

25 $535.00/$88.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
47 $645.00/$112.00 No Bid No Bid $750.00/$120.00
55 $675.00/$118.00 No Bid No Bid $750.00/$120.00

Contractors

Bid No. 17/18-02TS, Charter Bus, Activity Trips & Transportation Services

School Buses: Drop & Return w/in OC

School Buses: One Way w/in OC

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 



Category
Certified 

Transportation 
Services Inc.

First Student Inc.
JFK 

Transportation 
Co. Inc.

Lux Bus America 
Co.

Pacific Coachways

Contractors

No Bid No Bid $750.00/$120.00

No Bid No Bid $750.00/$120.00

No Bid No Bid $590.00/$105.00
School Buses:  Home to 
School Routes

Min 5 Hrs/5+ Hrs Min 5 Hrs/5+ Hrs Min 5 Hrs/5+ Hrs Min 5 Hrs/5+ Hrs

20 No Bid No Bid $400.00/$81.00 No Bid

24 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

W/C 5W 6P No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

72 $490.00/$80.00 No Bid $425.00/$81.00 No Bid

78 $500.00/$82.00 No Bid $448.00/$81.00 No Bid

84 $520.00/$84.00 No Bid $448.00/$81.00 No Bid

90 No Bid No Bid $525.00/$81.00 No Bid

Scenario 1 Total $2,607.00 No Bid No Bid $3,470.00 

Scenario 2 Total $1,308.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Scenario 3 Total $5,670.00 No Bid No Bid $6,600.00 

Scenario 4 Total $466.00 No Bid $970.00 No Bid

Scenario 5 Total $4,230.00 $455.00 $2,625.00 No Bid

Scenario 6 Total $4,935.00 $530.50 $3,150.00 No Bid

Scenario 7 Total $4,410.00 $4,095.00 $2,885.00 No Bid
Total for Scenarios                 
1 - 7

$23,626.00 $5,080.50 $9,630.00 $10,070.00 

Wheelchair Bus

See school bus & 
Motor Coach bids

No Bid 
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