*Bid Line Items 10 and 11 will not be awarded and have been removed from the bid.

RFP # 14/15-02NS

Branded Foods II: Smoothies, Sub Sandwiches and Salads

Line Description Annual uom Jan.1ba Juice It Up
Item Usage Juice
Smoothies
1 Smoothies Strawberry 120z 21,000 |12 oz NON-RESP | $ 2.20
2 Smoothies Mango 12 oz 2,000 |12 oz NON-RESP | $ 2.20
3 Smoothies Watermelon 12 oz 750 |12 oz NON-RESP [NO BID
4 Smoothies Other Flavor 12 oz 2,000 (12 oz NON-RESP | $ 2.20
Line L. Annual Sandwich ]
ltem Description Usage uoM Subway World Jersey Mikes
Submarine Sandwiches
5 6" Turkey 10,000 (6" NON-RESP | S 225(S 2.00
6 6" Deli Combo 3,000 |6" NON-RESP | $ 2.25 [NO BID
7 6" Roast Beef 1,500 |6" NO BID NO BID NO BID
8 6" Ham 1,000 |6" NO BID S 2251(8$ 2.00
9 6" Vegetarian 300 (6" NON-RESP | $ 2.25 |[NO BID
10 |6 TunaSalkad —5.000 |6
11 |6 ChickenSalad —6,000 |6
Triangle Sandwiches
12 [Turkey 200 NO BID S 1.70 INO BID
13 |Roast Beef 200 NO BID NO BID NO BID
14 |Ham 200 NO BID S 1.70 INO BID
15 |Tuna 200 NO BID S 1.70 INO BID
16 |Chicken Salad 200 NO BID S 1.70 INO BID
17 |Turkey Ham 200 NO BID NO BID NO BID
18 |[Egg 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID
19 |Various 100 NO BID S 1.70 INO BID

Key: Items highlighted yellow and blolded indicate bid award; NON-RESP indicates bidder was found to be Non
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*Bid Line Items 10 and 11 will not be awarded and have been removed from the bid.

RFP # 14/15-02NS

Branded Foods II: Smoothies, Sub Sandwiches and Salads

Itl::‘ Description A:JT;::I uom Subway Savr\;i\::;ch Jersey Mikes
Salads
20 |Chef 80z 2,000 |8 oz NON-RESP | $ 2.25 [NO BID
21 |Asian Chicken 8oz 300 |8 oz NO BID S 2.25 ([NO BID
22 |Caesar Chicken 8oz 600 |8 oz NON-RESP | $ 2.25 INO BID
23  |Tuna 8oz 200 |8 oz NO BID NO BID NO BID
24 |Fiesta Chicken 8oz 600 |8 oz NON-RESP | $ 2.25 [NO BID
25 |Mini Salad 17,000 |8 oz NO BID S 2.25 INO BID
Pita Sandwiches
26 |Turkey Pita, 70z 7 oz NO BID NO BID NO BID
27 |Deli Pita, 70z 7 0z NO BID NO BID NO BID
28 |Roast Beef Pita, 70z 7 0z NO BID NO BID NO BID
29 |Ham Pita, 70z 7 oz NO BID NO BID NO BID
30 ([Tuna Pita, 70z 7 oz NO BID NO BID NO BID
31 |[Fiesta Pita, 70z 7 oz NO BID NO BID NO BID

Key: Items highlighted yellow and blolded indicate bid award; NON-RESP indicates bidder was found to be Non
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