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IRWINE UM IFIEID
SCHOOL DISTRICT

THEATER EQUIPMENT - IRVINE HIGH SCHOOL

THEATER BLACK BOX EQUIPMENT AND RELATED SUPPLIES
BID AWARD MATRIX
BID OPENING 3/12/24 at 1:00 PM

WITHDREW BID

Full Compass Systems Apex Audio
Line
. Estimated . . Estimated . .
It;m Item Description Quantity Unit Cost Extended Price Quantity Unit Cost Extended Price

ETC ION XE with built in 2 $  9,17045|$  18,340.90 2 No Bid 2 S $ . 2 No Bid
1 |faders
2 |Acer Monitor 27" 4 $ 555.54| $ 2,222.16 4 No Bid 4 $ $ - 4 No Bid
3 Focus Remote 1 No Bid 1 No Bid 1 $ $ - 1 No Bid

%,“’ma'Q Color Force II 14 $ 539500 $  75,530.00 14 No Bid 14 $ $ - 14 No Bid
4
5 |Ayrton Ghibli-S 12 $ 9,331.40| $ 111,976.80 12 No Bid 12 $ $ - 12 No Bid

Source Four LED Lustr+

Series 3 (Source Four LED 80 $ 1,905.68 $  152,454.40 80 No Bid 80 $ $ - 80 No Bid
6 [No Lens)

Source 4 Ellipsoidal 750w, 20 $ 88295| $  17,659.00 20 No Bid 20 $ $ ; 20 No Bid
7 |w/stage pin

Source 4WRD II, retrofit .
8 |kit, black, w/Stage Pin 20 $ 55432 $ 11,086.40 20 658.00 | $ 13,160.00 20 $ $ - 20 No Bid

D60 Luster+ ETC LED 48 $ 1510238 72.491.04 48 No Bid 48 S $ . 48 No Bid
9 |Wash fixture
10 |Source 4 Lense Tube 4 $ 35795 $ 1,431.80 4 No Bid 4 $ $ - 4 No Bid
11 |Source 4 Lense Tube 24 $ 194321 $ 4,663.68 24 No Bid 24 $ $ - 24 No Bid
12 |Source 4 Lense Tube 30 $ 194321 $ 5,829.60 30 No Bid 30 $ $ - 30 No Bid
13 |Source 4 Lense Tube 8 $ 255.68( $ 2,045.44 8 No Bid 8 $ $ - 8 No Bid
14 |Source 4 Lense Tube 60 $ 194321 $ 11,659.20 60 No Bid 60 $ $ - 60 No Bid
15 |Source 4 Lense Tube 8 $ 28295( $ 2,263.60 8 No Bid 8 $ $ - 8 No Bid
16 |Source 4 Lense Tube 12 $ 194321 $ 2,331.84 12 No Bid 12 $ $ - 12 No Bid
17 |Source 4 Lense Tube 8 $ 28295( $ 2,263.60 8 No Bid 8 $ $ - 8 No Bid
18 |Source 4 Lense Tube 4 $ 313.64( $ 1,254.56 4 No Bid 4 $ $ - 4 No Bid
19 |Source 4 Lense Tube 4 $ 313.64( $ 1,254.56 4 No Bid 4 $ $ - 4 No Bid
20 |Source 4 Drop in Iris 10 $ 112.50| $ 1,125.00 10 No Bid 10 $ $ - 10 No Bid

Source 4 Gobo/ Pattern 40 $ 8.86| $ 354.40 40 No Bid 40 $ $ - 40 No Bid
21 |Holder

Source 4 Gobo Pattern 4 3 12.95| $ 51.80 4 No Bid 4 S S - 4 No Bid
22 |Holder
23 |Source 4 Top Hat 22 $ 2045| $ 449.90 22 No Bid 22 $ $ - 22 No Bid
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IRWINE UM IFIEID
SCHOOL DISTRICT

THEATER BLACK BOX EQUIPMENT AND RELATED SUPPLIES

BID AWARD MATRIX

BID OPENING 3/12/24 at 1:00 PM

” ETC D60 Luster+ Top Hat 40 $ 31.40| $ 1,256.00 40 No Bid 40 $ $ 40 No Bid
25 Ezfs D60 Round Field 48 $ 45688 2,192.64 48 No Bid 48 $ $ 48 No Bid
26 |ETC D60 Floor Stand 20 $ 68.18| $ 1,363.60 20 No Bid 20 $ $ 20 No Bid
27 |ETC D60 C-Clamp 50 $ 18.00| $ 900.00 50 2248 | $ 1,124.00 50 $ $ 50 No Bid
28 Hang Force Color 72, black 12 $ 220.00( $ 2,640.00 12 No Bid 12 $ $ 12 No Bid
29 |The Mega-Claw, black 26 $ 38.67| $ 1,005.42 26 No Bid 26 $ $ 26 No Bid
30 |ETC Safety Cable 170 $ 1023 $ 1,739.10 170 12491 8§ 2,123.30 170 $ $ 170 No Bid
31 |ETC Dimmer Doubler 8 $ 19091 $ 1,527.28 8 No Bid 8 $ $ 8 No Bid
32 |Follow Spot 2 No Bid 2 No Bid 2 $ $ 2 No Bid
33 |Follow Spot Stand 2 No Bid 2 No Bid 2 $ $ 2 No Bid
34 |ETC Dimmer doubler 8 $ 19091 $ 1,527.28 8 No Bid 8 $ $ 8 No Bid

ETC Response MK2 Port 4 $ 86932| $  3,477.28 4 No Bid 4 $ $ 4 No Bid

Gateway
35 |Hazer 1 No Bid 1 No Bid 1 $ $ 1 No Bid
36 |Hazer Fluid 1 No Bid 1 No Bid 1 $ $ 1 No Bid
37 |Cheeseborough- Fixed 10 $ 2890| § 289.00 10 No Bid 10 $ $ 10 No Bid
38 |Cheeseborough- Swivel 10 $ 3547| $ 354.70 10 No Bid 10 $ $ 10 No Bid
39 6' Pipe (1 1/2") 10 $ 32.00| $ 320.00 10 No Bid 10 $ $ 10 No Bid
40 12' Pipe (1 1/2") 10 $ 62.00| $ 620.00 10 No Bid 10 $ $ 10 No Bid
41 |1 1/2" boom tie off 10 $ 3343| $ 334.30 10 No Bid 10 $ $ 10 No Bid
" 50 LBS. Base 8 $ 45349 $ 3,627.92 8 No Bid 8 $ $ 8 No Bid
4 25 lbs. sand bags 24 $ 25.58| $ 613.92 24 No Bid 24 $ $ 24 No Bid
44 |DMX 5' 60 $ 3576 $ 2,145.60 60 No Bid 60 $ $ 60 No Bid
45 |DMX 10' 100 $ 41221 $ 4,122.00 100 No Bid 100 $ $ 100 No Bid
46 |DMX 25' 40 $ 59.01| $ 2,360.40 40 No Bid 40 $ $ 40 No Bid
47 |DMX 50' 12 $ 87.67| $ 1,052.04 12 No Bid 12 $ $ 12 No Bid
48 |DMX 100’ 10 $ 13849| $ 1,384.90 10 No Bid 10 $ $ 10 No Bid
49 25" Ethercon 8 $ 10291] $ 823.28 8 No Bid 8 $ $ 8 No Bid
50 50' Ethercon 8 $ 14291 $ 1,143.28 8 No Bid 8 $ $ 8 No Bid
51 100' Ethercon 6 $ 199.01| $ 1,194.06 6 No Bid 6 $ $ 6 No Bid
52 |Coupler- Ethercom 8 $ 63.02| $ 504.16 8 No Bid 8 $ $ 8 No Bid
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IRWINE UM IFIEID
SCHOOL DISTRICT

THEATER BLACK BOX EQUIPMENT AND RELATED SUPPLIES

BID AWARD MATRIX

BID OPENING 3/12/24 at 1:00 PM

53 Socopex 100' 2 $ 1,019.30( $ 2,038.60 2 No Bid 2 $ $ 2 No Bid
54 |Socopex 50' 2 $ 633.08| $ 1,266.16 2 No Bid 2 $ $ 2 No Bid
55 |Soco Break-In Stage Pin 2 $ 232.73| $ 465.46 2 No Bid 2 $ $ 2 No Bid
56 |Soco Break-Out Stage Pin 2 $ 264.65| $ 529.30 2 No Bid 2 $ $ 2 No Bid
57 |Soco Break-In Edison 2 $ 23541( $ 470.82 2 No Bid 2 $ $ 2 No Bid
53 Soco Break-Out Edison 2 $ 282.67( $ 565.34 2 No Bid 2 $ $ 2 No Bid
59 |E-String 4 $ 152.79| $ 611.16 4 No Bid 4 $ $ 4 No Bid
60 E-String 8 $ 22523 $ 1,801.84 8 No Bid 8 $ $ 8 No Bid
61 |5'Edison 14 $ 3733| $ 522.62 14 No Bid 14 $ $ 14 No Bid
62 |10' Edison 16 $ 48.02( $ 768.32 16 No Bid 16 $ $ 16 No Bid
63 |25' Edison 5 $ 69.77| $ 348.85 5 No Bid 5 $ $ 5 No Bid
64 |50' Edison 10 $ 99.77| $ 997.70 10 No Bid 10 $ $ 10 No Bid
65 100" Edison 8 $ 179.65| $ 1,437.20 8 No Bid 8 $ $ 8 No Bid
66 Power Strip 6 $ 2201| $ 132.06 6 No Bid 6 $ $ 6 No Bid
67 |10' Stage Pin 8 $ 40.12 $ 320.96 8 No Bid 8 $ $ 8 No Bid
68 |25' Stage Pin 10 $ 66.98| $ 669.80 10 No Bid 10 $ $ 10 No Bid
69 |50' Stage Pin 5 $ 93.84| $ 469.20 5 No Bid 5 $ $ 5 No Bid
70 |100' Stage Pin 5 $ 173721 $ 868.60 5 No Bid 5 $ $ 5 No Bid
71 |5' PowerCon 20 $ 30.70 | $ 614.00 20 No Bid 20 $ $ 20 No Bid
7” 10' PowerCon 20 $ 4151 $ 830.20 20 No Bid 20 $ $ 20 No Bid
- 25' PowerCon 20 $ 68.02| $ 1,360.40 20 No Bid 20 $ $ 20 No Bid
4 50" PowerCon 18 $ 10535 $ 1,896.30 18 No Bid 18 $ $ 18 No Bid
75 100' PowerCon 8 $ 19430 $ 1,554.40 8 No Bid 8 $ $ 8 No Bid
% 10' TrulCon power 20 $ 4884 $ 976.80 20 No Bid 20 $ $ 20 No Bid
7 25' Trul Con power 20 $ 75.35| $ 1,507.00 20 No Bid 20 $ $ 20 No Bid
23 50' TrulCon power 18 $ 111.28( $ 2,003.04 18 No Bid 18 $ $ 18 No Bid

PowerCON Breakout 2 $ 1,007.27( $ 2,014.54 2 No Bid 2 $ $ 2 No Bid
79
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IRWINE UM IFIEID
SCHOOL DISTRICT

THEATER BLACK BOX EQUIPMENT AND RELATED SUPPLIES

BID AWARD MATRIX

BID OPENING 3/12/24 at 1:00 PM
80 Triple Tap- Black 10 $ 523 $ 52.30 10 No Bid 10 $ $ 10 No Bid
81 |2 fers 10 $ 71.16| $ 711.60 10 No Bid 10 $ $ 10 No Bid
0 HPL 750 180 $ 1453 $ 2,615.40 180 No Bid 180 $ $ 180 No Bid
83 |Gam Check 1 No Bid 1 No Bid 1 $ $ 1 No Bid
Ratcheting Ultimate Focus 4 No Bid 4 No Bid 4 g g 4 No Bid
84 |Tool
85 |Socket adapter 4 No Bid 4 No Bid 4 $ $ 4 No Bid
Cable Trunks 4 $ 991.42( $ 3,965.68 4 No Bid 4 $ $ 4 1,108.00 | $ 4,432.00
86
87 |Yates Harness- S 1 $ 52221| $ 522.21 1 No Bid 1 $ $ 1 No Bid
88 |Yates Harness- M 1 $ 52221| $ 522.21 1 No Bid 1 $ $ 1 No Bid
89 |Yates Harness- L 1 $ 52221| $ 522.21 1 No Bid 1 $ $ 1 No Bid
90 |Yates Harness- XL 1 $ 52221| $ 522.21 1 No Bid 1 $ $ 1 No Bid
01 Safety Lanyard 4 $ 175.81| $ 703.24 4 No Bid 4 $ $ 4 No Bid
92 |CMI Sheaves 4 $ 78.49| $ 313.96 4 No Bid 4 $ $ 4 No Bid
93 |300' Rigger's Rope 1 $ 665.00| $ 665.00 1 No Bid 1 $ $ 1 No Bid
94 |Carabineer 10 $ 14.60| $ 146.00 10 No Bid 10 $ $ 10 No Bid
95 Locking Carabineer 10 No Bid 10 No Bid 10 $ $ 10 No Bid
06 Sling 24" 10 $ 872 $ 87.20 10 No Bid 10 $ $ 10 No Bid
o7 Spansets 36" 10 $ 20.17| $ 201.70 10 No Bid 10 $ $ 10 No Bid
98 |Swage Tool 1 $ 327.30| $ 327.30 1 No Bid 1 $ $ 1 No Bid
99 1/8" Oval nicopress sleeves 1000 $ 064| $ 640.00 1000 No Bid 1000 $ $ 1000 No Bid
100 |Go- gauge 1 No Bid 1 No Bid 1 $ $ 1 No Bid
101 |Cable Cutters 1 $ 832| $ 8.32 1 No Bid 1 $ $ 1 No Bid
1/8" Aircraft Cable . .
. 1000 $ 0.34] % 340.00 1000 No Bid 1000 $ $ 1000 No Bid
102 [Thimbles
103 |Wire Rope 4000 $ 0.57] $ 2,280.00 4000 No Bid 4000 $ $ 4000 No Bid
104 90° Shackle Plate 60 $ 798 $ 478.80 60 No Bid 60 $ $ 60 No Bid
105 3/8" Shackles 250 $ 10.03 | $ 2,507.50 250 No Bid 250 $ $ 250 No Bid
Adjustable suspension . .
. 200 $ 26.16 | $ 5,232.00 200 No Bid 200 $ $ 200 No Bid
106 |device
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IRWINE UM IFIEID
SCHOOL DISTRICT

THEATER BLACK BOX EQUIPMENT AND RELATED SUPPLIES

BID AWARD MATRIX

BID OPENING 3/12/24 at 1:00 PM
107 [Uncle Buddy Tension lock 216.60 649.80 3 No Bid 3 No Bid
108 |Sandbag Cart 996.58 996.58 1 No Bid 1 No Bid
Ladder 8 Double Sided 405.25 405.25 1 No Bid 1 No Bid
109 "A"
1o %zﬂder 10" Double Sided 509.81 509.81 1 No Bid 1 No Bid
. %Zf,lder 12" Double Sided 595.40 595.40 1 No Bid 1 No Bid
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IRWINE UM IFIEID
SCHOOL DISTRICT

|Hardwired ClearCom System

THEATER BLACK BOX EQUIPMENT AND RELATED SUPPLIES
BID AWARD MATRIX
BID OPENING 3/12/24 ;

WITHDREW BID

Full Compass Systems Apex Audio
Line
.. Estimated . . Estimated . .
It;m Item Description Quantity Unit Cost Extended Price Quantity Unit Cost Extended Price
112 Audio playback No Bid 1 No Bid 1 $ $ - 1 No Bid
113 Dante Interface Software No Bid 1 No Bid 1 $ $ - 1 No Bid
yamaha dante excelerator . .
114 |PCT card 1,477.85| $ 1,477.85 1 No Bid 1 $ $ - 1 No Bid
AKITO Node duo . . .
115 |thunderbolt chasis No Bid ! No Bid ! $ $ ) ! No Bid
116 [Audio Recording Software No Bid 1 No Bid 1 $ $ - 1 No Bid
iMac No Bid 1 No Bid 1 $ $ - 1 No Bid
117
wireless mouse and . :
118 |keyboard No Bid 2 $ 4569 | $ 91.38 2 $ $ - 2 No Bid
Rack Mount for Mac Mini No Bid 1 No Bid 1 $ $ ; 1 No Bid
119 |Computer
120 Rack Mounted PCs No Bid 4 No Bid 4 $ $ - 4 No Bid
Mac Mini for Rack/iMac . . .
121 |for Control Room No Bid 1 No Bid 1 $ $ - 1 No Bid
Newtek Spark plus IO 4k 995.00| $  3,980.00 4 $ 86125 $ 3,445.00 4 $ $ - 4 No Bid
122 |boxes
123 KVM switch No Bid 1 No Bid 1 $ $ - 1 No Bid
124 |Tricaster TC1 No Bid 1 $ 15,195.00| $ 15,195.00 1 $ $ - 1 No Bid
tricaster video switcher No Bid 1 $ 902000 $ 9,020.00 1 $ $ . 1 No Bid
125 |control panel
6
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IRWINE UM IFIEID
SCHOOL DISTRICT

THEATER BLACK BOX EQUIPMENT AND RELATED SUPPLIES

BID AWARD MATRIX

BID OPENING 3/12/24 at 1:00 PM
Tricaster NC1 Studio I/O . . .
126 |Module No Bid No Bid 1 $ No Bid
video reference LED
monitors Dell UltraSharp No Bid No Bid 1 $ No Bid
127 |32 4K USB-C Monitor
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IRWINE UM IFIEID
SCHOOL DISTRICT

BLACK BOX EQUIPMENT - IRVINE HIGH SCHOOL

THEATER BLACK BOX EQUIPMENT AND RELATED SUPPLIES

BID AWARD MATRIX

BID OPENING 3/12/24

**ETC=Electronic Theatre Controls

WITHDREW BID

Full Compass Systems Apex Audio
Line
.. Estimated . . Estimated . .

It;m Item Description Quantity Unit Cost Extended Price Quandity Unit Cost Extended Price

ETC ION XE with built in 1 $  9,17045|$  9,170.45 1 No Bid 1 S S . 1 No Bid
128 |faders
129 |Acer Monitor 27" 2 $ 555.54| $ 1,111.08 2 No Bid 2 $ $ - 2 No Bid
130 Ipad Pro 1 No Bid 1 No Bid 1 $ $ - 1 No Bid

ETC ColorSource Spot 35 $ 1,326.14 $  46,414.90 35 No Bid 35 $ $ - 35 No Bid
131 [vseries

ETC ColorSource PAR . .
132 |(Wash type fixture) 20 $ 709.09( $ 14,181.80 20 No Bid 20 $ $ - 20 No Bid
133 Altman Spectra Cyc 200 10 No Bid 10 No Bid 10 $ $ - 10 No Bid
134 |Ayrton Ghibli-S 4 $ 9,331.40| $ 37,325.60 4 No Bid 4 $ $ - 4 No Bid
135 |[Source 4 Lense Tube 8 $ 194321 $ 1,554.56 8 No Bid 8 $ $ - 8 No Bid
136 |Source 4 Lense Tube 14 $ 194321 $ 2,720.48 14 No Bid 14 $ $ - 14 No Bid
137 |Source 4 Lense Tube 4 $ 28295( $ 1,131.80 4 No Bid 4 $ $ - 4 No Bid
138 |[Source 4 Lense Tube 14 $ 194321 $ 2,720.48 14 No Bid 14 $ $ - 14 No Bid
139 |[Source 4 Lense Tube 4 $ 28295( $ 1,131.80 4 No Bid 4 $ $ - 4 No Bid
140 |Source 4 Lense Tube 4 $ 19432 $ 777.28 4 No Bid 4 $ $ - 4 No Bid
141 |Source 4 Lense Tube 4 $ 28295( $ 1,131.80 4 No Bid 4 $ $ - 4 No Bid
142 [Source 4 Drop in Iris 4 $ 112.50| $ 450.00 4 No Bid 4 $ $ - 4 No Bid

Source 4 Gobo/ Pattern 12 $ 8.86| $ 106.32 12 No Bid 12 S $ . 12 No Bid
143 |Holder

Source 4 Gobo/ Pattern . .
144 |Holder 4 $ 1295 $ 51.80 4 No Bid 4 $ $ - 4 No Bid
145 [Source 4 Top Hat 12 $ 2045| $ 245.40 12 No Bid 12 $ $ - 12 No Bid
146 |ETC Safety Cable 70 $ 1023 $ 716.10 70 12.49] § 874.30 70 $ $ - 70 No Bid
147 25 Ibs. sand bags 24 $ 2558 $ 613.92 24 No Bid 24 $ $ - 24 No Bid
148 |DMX 5' 20 $ 3576 $ 715.20 20 No Bid 20 $ $ - 20 No Bid
149 |DMX 10' 30 $ 4122 $ 1,236.60 30 No Bid 30 $ $ - 30 No Bid
150 |DMX 25' 40 $ 59.01| $ 2,360.40 40 No Bid 40 $ $ - 40 No Bid
151 |DMX 50' 10 $ 87.67| $ 876.70 10 No Bid 10 $ $ - 10 No Bid
152 |DMX 100' 8 $ 138.49| $ 1,107.92 8 No Bid 8 $ $ - 8 No Bid
153 25' Ethercon 4 $ 10291 $ 411.64 4 No Bid 4 $ $ - 4 No Bid

8
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IRWINE UM IFIEID
SCHOOL DISTRICT

THEATER BLACK BOX EQUIPMENT AND RELATED SUPPLIES

BID AWARD MATRIX

BID OPENING 3/12/24 at 1:00 PM

154 50' Ethercon 4 $ 14291| $ 571.64 4 No Bid 4 $ $ 4 No Bid
155 100" Ethercon 3 $ 199.01| $ 597.03 3 No Bid 3 $ $ 3 No Bid
156 |5' Edison 8 $ 37.33| § 298.64 8 No Bid 8 $ $ 8 No Bid
157 |10' Edison 6 $ 48.02( $ 288.12 6 No Bid 6 $ $ 6 No Bid
158 |25' Edison 10 $ 69.77| $ 697.70 10 No Bid 10 $ $ 10 No Bid
159 |50' Edison 4 $ 99.77| $ 399.08 4 No Bid 4 $ $ 4 No Bid
160 100" Edison 4 $ 179.65| $ 718.60 4 No Bid 4 $ $ 4 No Bid
161 Power Strip 6 $ 2201| $ 132.06 6 No Bid 6 $ $ 6 No Bid
162 [5' PowerCon 10 $ 30.70| § 307.00 10 No Bid 10 $ $ 10 No Bid
163 10' PowerCon 10 $ 41.51( $ 415.10 10 No Bid 10 $ $ 10 No Bid
164 25' PowerCon 10 $ 68.02 $ 680.20 10 No Bid 10 $ $ 10 No Bid
165 50' PowerCon 6 $ 10535| $ 632.10 6 No Bid 6 $ $ 6 No Bid
166 100" PowerCon 4 $ 19430 $ 777.20 4 No Bid 4 $ $ 4 No Bid
167 10' TrulCon power 10 $ 48.84| $ 488.40 10 No Bid 10 $ $ 10 No Bid
168 25' Trul Con power 20 $ 75.35| $ 1,507.00 20 No Bid 20 $ $ 20 No Bid
169 50' Trul Con power 6 $ 111.28| $ 667.68 6 No Bid 6 $ $ 6 No Bid

PowerCON Breakout 2 $ 1,007.27| $ 2,014.54 2 No Bid 2 $ $ 2 No Bid
170
m Triple Tap- Black 5 $ 523| $ 26.15 5 No Bid 5 $ $ 5 No Bid
172 |2 fers 5 $ 71.16| $ 355.80 5 No Bid 5 $ $ 5 No Bid
173 |Gam Check 1 No Bid 1 No Bid 1 $ $ 1 No Bid

Ratcheting Ultimate Focus ) No Bid ) No Bid ) g 3 ) No Bid
174 [Tool
175 [Socket adapter 2 No Bid 2 No Bid 2 $ $ 2 No Bid

Cable Trunks 2 $ 991.42( $ 1,982.84 2 No Bid 2 $ $ 2 $ 1,10800( $ 2,216.00
176
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THEATER BLACK BOX EQUIPMENT AND RELATED SUPPLIES
BID AWARD MATRIX

-
IRWINE UM IFIEID
SCHOOL DISTRICT

BID OPENING 3/12/24 at 1:00 PM___

ClearCom FreeSpeak 2 2 $  10386.63|$  20,773.26 2 No Bid 2 $ $ 2 $ 10,004.00| $ 20,008.00
177 |base station

ClearCom FreeSpeak 2 10 $ 1,866.28 [ $  18,662.80 10 No Bid 10 $ $ 10 $ 1,797.00| $ 17,970.00
178 |Beltpack

ClearCom FreeSpeak 2 4 $ 1,62645( $  6,505.80 4 No Bid 4 $ $ 4 $  1,566.00| $  6,264.00
179 |Active Antenna

ClearCom FreeSpeak 2 . .
180 |Antenna Splitter 1 $ 1,962.21 $ 1,962.21 1 No Bid 1 $ $ 1 No Bid

ClearCom FreeSpeak 2 2 $ 588.66| $ 1,177.32 2 No Bid 2 $ $ 2 $  567.00] $  1,134.00
181 |Battery Charger

ClearCom FreeSpeak 2 20 $ 65.76| $ 1,315.20 20 No Bid 20 $ $ 20 $ 63.00| $  1,260.00
182 |Battery
183 |ClearCom Headset 10 $ 31831 $ 3,183.10 10 No Bid 10 $ $ 10 $ 30600 S  3,060.00

Rack for ClearCom .
184 |FroeSposk 2 1 $ 536.09| $ 536.09 1 No Bid 1 $ $ 1 $  599.00| $ 599.00

Rack drawers for ClearCom 3 $ 143.99] $ 431.97 3 No Bid 3 $ $ 3 $ 16400 $  492.00
185 |FreeSpeak 2

Power Distro for ClearCom| $ 188.04| $ 188.04 | S 7786|$ 7786 I $ $ I No Bid
186 |FreeSpeak 2

Rack screws for ClearCom 1 $ 4258] s 42.58 1 $  5499($ 5499 1 $ $ 1 No Bid
187 |Free Speak 2

Yamaha CL3 Digital Audio 1 $ 2356110 $  23,561.10 1 No Bid 1 $ $ 1 $ 21,483.00| $ 21,483.00
188 |Console
189 |Yamaha Rio 3224-D2 1 S 923651]$ 923651 1 No Bid 1 $ $ 1 S 842200] $  8422.00
190 |portable rolling rack 24u 1 No Bid 1 No Bid 1 $ $ 1 No Bid
1o |QSCKI2 5 $ 91945 $ 459725 5 No Bid 5 $ $ 5 $  864.00| S  4,320.00
192 |Q-sys Core as needed No Bid as needed No Bid as needed $ $ as needed No Bid
193 |Extron System as needed No Bid as needed No Bid asneeded | $ $ as needed No Bid
194 |Shure ULXD Receivers 2 $ 525233| $  10,504.66 2 S 431006] $  8620.12 2 $ $ 2 $ 519400 $ 10388.00
195 |Shure ULXD Body pack 16 $ 461.63| $ 7,386.08 16 $  37848|$ 6,055.68 16 $ $ 16 S 45600 S 7.296.00
196 |Shure ULXD handhelds 8 $ 49535 $ 3,962.80 8 S 406.02] S 3248.16 8 $ $ 8 S 49000 $  3.920.00
197 |Shure paddle antenna 2 $ 329.07] $ 658.14 2 S 30491[S  609.82 2 $ $ 2 S 32400] $  648.00
198 |antenna distro 1 $ 500.00] $ 500.00 1 S 46329]$ 46329 1 $ $ 1 S 49400 S 494.00
199 |Denon BT CD player 1 $ 380.00] $ 380.00 1 S 30735]$ 30735 1 $ $ 1 No Bid
200 Audio playback 1 No Bid 1 No Bid 1 $ $ 1 No Bid
201 Dante Interface Software 1 No Bid 1 No Bid 1 $ $ 1 No Bid
202 [Audio Recording Software 1 No Bid 1 No Bid 1 $ $ 1 No Bid
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IRWINE UM IFIEID
SCHOOL DISTRICT

THEATER BLACK BOX EQUIPMENT AND RELATED SUPPLIES

BID AWARD MATRIX

BID - OPENING 3/12/24 at 1:00.PM

iMac No Bid 1 No Bid 1 $ $ No Bid
203

wireless mouse and . :
204 |keyboard No Bid 1 $ 4569 | $ 45.69 1 $ $ No Bid
205 Rack Mounted PCs No Bid 1 No Bid 1 $ $ No Bid
206 |Video camera - sony 9,651.16| $ 9,651.16 1 $ 723557(% 7,235.57 1 $ $ No Bid
207 |PZT remote control panel 1,97093 | $ 1,970.93 1 $ 1597.13($ 1,597.13 1 $ $ No Bid

Digital Projector - main . . .
208 |theater No Bid 1 No Bid 1 $ $ No Bid
200 Tricaster Mini 4k No Bid 1 $ 7,794.00| $ 7,794.00 1 $ $ No Bid

tricaster Mini CS control No Bid 1 $ 2246.16|$ 2.246.16 1 S $ No Bid
210 |[panel

Newtek Spark plus I/O 4k No Bid 2 $  86125|$ 1,722.50 2 $ $ No Bid
211 |boxes

video reference LED No Bid 1 No Bid 1 $ $ No Bid
212 |monitors

rack mounted blu-ray No Bid 1 No Bid 1 S $ No Bid
213 |[player

11
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ELEMENTARY SCHOOL LIGHTING

IRWINE UM IFIEID
SCHOOL DISTRICT

THEATER BLACK BOX EQUIPMENT AND RELATED SUPPLIES

BID AWARD MATRIX

BID OPENING 3/12/24 at 1:00 PM

**ETC=Electronic Theatre Controls

WITHDREW BID

Full Compass Systems Apex Audio

Line 5 5
It;m Item Description lésl?amn?itt;d Unit Cost Ex;i;:led l(«l)sltllamn:itt;d Unit Cost Extended Price
214 |ETC Nomad Puck 1 $ 473.86 | § 473.86 1 No Bid 1 $ $ 1 No Bid
215 |Acer Monitor 27" 2 $ 555.54|$ 1,111.08 2 No Bid 2 $ $ 2 No Bid
216 |Lighting C Clamp 32 $ 18.00 | $ 576.00 32 $ 224818  719.36 32 $ $ 32 No Bid
217 |[Saftey Cables 32 $ 1023 | $ 327.36 32 $ 12491 $  399.68 32 $ $ 32 No Bid

1.5 m (5 ft) Edison plug to

TRUEI receptacle, UL 5 $ 51.14( $ 255.70 5 No Bid 5 $ $ 5 No Bid
218 |1573, black

1.5 m (5 ft) TRUEI plug to

TRUEI receptacle fixture 16 $ SL14|s 81824 16 No Bid 16 S $ 16 No Bid

power jumper, UL rated,
219 |[black

3 m (10 ft) TRUEI1 plug to

TRUEI receptacle fixture 16 $ 57958 927.20 16 No Bid 16 S S 16 No Bid

power jumper, UL rated,
220 |black

1.5 m (5 ft) powerCON

plug (gray) to TRUEI 4 $ 51.14]$ 20456 4 No Bid 4 $ $ 4 No Bid

receptacle adapter cable,
221 |black

1.5 m (5 ft) TRUEI plug to

powerCON receptacle 4 $ 51.14|$  204.56 4 No Bid 4 $ $ 4 No Bid

(blue) adapter cable, black ’ ’
222

5 ft powerCON to

powerCON fixture to 16 $ 51.14( $ 818.24 16 No Bid 16 $ $ 16 No Bid
223 |fixture jumper

10 ft powerCON to

powerCON fixture to 16 $ 5795 $ 927.20 16 No Bid 16 $ $ 16 No Bid
224 |fixture jumper
225 |26° EDLT lens 2 $ 255.68 | $ 511.36 2 No Bid 2 $ $ 2 No Bid
226 [36° EDLT lens 4 $ 255.68| % 1,022.72 4 No Bid 4 $ $ 4 No Bid
227 |Lighting Donut No Bid No Bid $ $ No Bid
228 |Drop in Iris 8 $ 112.50 [ $ 900.00 8 No Bid 8 $ $ 8 No Bid
o gﬁzv{,hgzglycal Multiverse 6 $ 376.05|$ 225630 6 No Bid 6 $ $ 6 No Bid
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IRWINE UM IFIEID
SCHOOL DISTRICT

THEATER BLACK BOX EQUIPMENT AND RELATED SUPPLIES
BID AWARD MATRIX

BID - OPENING 3/12/24 at 1:00.PM
Response Mk2 2-Port 2 869.32|$ 1,738.64 2 No Bid 2 2 No Bid
230 |Gateway
Response Mk2 2-Port . .
231 |Gateway Box - 5114 $  102.28 2 No Bid 2 2 No Bid
Response Mk2 2-Port . .
232 |Gateway Power Supply 2 4773 | $ 95.46 2 No Bid 2 2 No Bid
233 Response SMPTE Gateway No Bid No Bid No Bid
234 |Color Source CYC 8 1,431.82 [ $ 11,454.56 8 No Bid 8 8 No Bid
235 Color Source Fresnel V 14 1,090091 | $ 15,272.74 14 No Bid 14 14 No Bid
ColorSource Spot V Light . )
236 |Engine with Shutter Barrel 6 1,326.14 $ 7,956.84 6 No Bid 6 6 No Bid
| RU Brush Grommet 1 53.03|8  53.03 1 $  4995[$ 4995 1 1 No Bid
237 |Panel
Pro CO 6' 5 pin DMX M to .
238 |DMX F 14 12.73 | $ 178.22 14 No Bid 14 14 3500 $ 490.00
Pro CO 10'5 pin DMX M .
239 |to DMX F 14 15.06 | $ 210.84 14 No Bid 14 14 36.00 [ $ 504.00
Bluetooth Keyboard and 1 No Bid 1 No Bid 1 1 No Bid
240 |mouse with usb reciever
25' Shielded cat 6 cable 2 37.14 | $ 74.28 2 No Bid 2 2 No Bid
241
5' Shielded cat 6 cable 2 1341 $ 26.82 2 No Bid 2 2 No Bid
242
243 Network Switch 1 No Bid 1 No Bid 1 1 No Bid
244 Network Switch power cord 1 No Bid 1 No Bid 1 1 No Bid
13 Updated 3/15/2024
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UNIVERSITY PARK ELEMENTARY SCHOOL MPR

IRWINE UM IFIEID
SCHOOL DISTRICT

Line
Item

Item Description

245

SR Series RACK, HIGH
CAPACITY, SPACE
SAVING DESIGN WITH
EASY ACCESS TO REAR
EQUIPMENT- 32 3/8"D X
90 3/4"H

1,673.62

THEATER BLACK BOX EQUIPMENT AND RELATED SUPPLIES
BID AWARD MATRIX

BID OPENING 3/12/24 at 1:00 PM
**ETC=Electronic Theatre Controls

1,673.62

1,649.95

$

1,649.95

WITHDREW BID

Full Compass Systems

Apex Audio

Estimated
Quantity

Unit Cost

Extended
Price

Estimated
Quantity

Unit Cost

Extended Price

No Bid

246

40 RU Vented Front Door
for SR, ERK, MRK and
WRK Racks, 64% Open

453.83

453.83

549.95

549.95

No Bid

247

Middle Atlantic Latch,UD
seiries Drawers

16.28

32.56

15.99

31.98

No Bid

248

Middle Atlantic SFD-KEY

5.14

10.28

4.99

9.98

No Bid

249

Middle Atlantic BR1

53.03

106.06

49.95

99.90

No Bid

250

1 RU BRUSH GROMMET
PANEL, FLEXIBLE
CONNECTOR
KNOCKOUTS,
FLANGED STEEL WITH
POWDER COAT FINISH

47.92

95.84

44.99

89.98

No Bid

251

BLANK PANEL 1 RU
ALUMINUM, 12 PC
CONTRACTOR PACK,
FLAT ALUMINUM WITH
BLACK FINISH

120.53

120.53

No Bid

No Bid

252

BLANK PANEL 2 RU
ALUMINUM, 12 PC
CONTRACTOR PACK,
FLAT ALUMINUM WITH
BLACK FINISH

156.70

156.70

No Bid

No Bid

253

Furman CN2400S Rack
Power

714.95

1,429.90

2 $

386.87

773.74

No Bid

254

Qsys 110f

2,906.98

2,906.98

No Bid

$§  2,904.00

2,904.00

14
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IRWINE UM IFIEID
SCHOOL DISTRICT

THEATER BLACK BOX EQUIPMENT AND RELATED SUPPLIES
BID AWARD MATRIX

RIN OPENING 3/12/24 at 1:00 PM

255 |Qsys Camera 1 $ 3,98242| % 3,982.42 1 No Bid 1 $ $ 1 $ 3,826.00 | $ 3,826.00
256 |Qsys Core 8 Flex 1 $ 2,146.40 | $ 2,146.40 1 No Bid 1 $ $ 1 $ 2,021.00]$ 2,021.00
257 |Qsys Touch Screen 1 $ 1,395.52|$ 1,395.52 1 No Bid 1 $ $ 1 $ 1,314.00 [ $ 1,314.00
258 |Qsys Scripting License 1 $ 340.64 | $ 340.64 1 No Bid 1 $ $ 1 $ 334.00 | $ 334.00
259 |Qsys UCI license 1 $ 172.15] $ 172.15 1 No Bid 1 $ $ 1 $ 169.00 | $ 169.00
260 [Qysys Dante license 32 1 $ 673.95] $ 673.95 1 No Bid 1 $ $ 1 $ 662.00 | § 662.00
261 QSYS VIDEO ENCODER 1 $ 1,64826 [ § 1,648.26 1 No Bid 1 $ $ 1 $ 1,552.00 | $ 1,552.00
262 QSYS VIDEO DECODER 1 $ 3,054.77| $ 3,054.77 1 No Bid 1 $ $ 1 $ 2,877.00 | $ 2,877.00

QSYS ENCODER .
263 |POWER SUPPLY 1 $ 208.78 | $ 208.78 1 No Bid 1 $ $ 1 $ 197.00 | $ 197.00

ULXD4Q Quad-Channel 1 $  525233|$ 525233 1 $ 4301.80|$ 4,301.80 1 $ $ 1 $  519400|$  5,194.00
264 |Digital Wireless Receiver

ULXD2/KSM9 SHURE

HANDHELD

TRANSMITTER WITH 4 $ 1,104.16 | $ 4,416.64 4 $ 903.33 3,613.32 4 $ $ 4 $ 1,089.00 | $ 4,356.00
265 |KSM9 MICROPHONE

ULXD1 SHURE DIGITAL

WIRELESS BODYPACK

TRANSMITTER WITH

MINIATURE 4-PIN 4 $ 461.63 | $ 1,846.52 4 $ 378.48 1,513.92 4 $ $ 4 $ 456.00 $ 1,824.00

CONNECTOR * ** G50

sk ok sk
266

E6

HEADSETMICWITHME

DSENSITIVITY, .

LIGHT BEIGE, TAF FOR 4 No bid 4 $ 357.12 1,428.48 4 $ $ 4 $ 344.00 | $ 1,376.00

SHURE, "BENDING
267 |BOOM", 2M CABLE

UAS874US SHURE

ACTIVE DIRECTIONAL

UHF ANTENNA WITH

INTEGRATED 2 $ 329.07 | $ 658.14 2 $ 304.91 609.82 2 $ $ 2 $ 325.00 $ 650.00

AMPLIFIER (470-
268 |698MHZ)
269 [Shure -UAS850 2 $ 91.86| $ 183.72 2 $ 85.12 170.24 2 $ $ 2 $ 91.00 | $ 182.00
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IRWINE UM IFIEID
SCHOOL DISTRICT

THEATER BLACK BOX EQUIPMENT AND RELATED SUPPLIES

BID AWARD MATRIX

BID OPENING 3/12/24 at 1:00 PM
DENON DN-500BD MKII
BLU-RAY DVD AND 1 No Bid 1 $ 366.71 | $ 366.71 1 $ $ 1 $ 345.00 [ $ 345.00
CD/SD/USB PLAYER.
270
Atlona Switcher 1 No Bid 1 $ 2,641.00| $ 2,641.00 1 $ $ 1 No Bid
271
Atlona AT-UHD-EX- 3 No bid 3 $ 33700 $ 1,011.00 3 $ $ 3 No Bid
272 100CE-RX
Atlona HDVS-210H-TX- 2 No bid 2 $  609.00| S 1,218.00 2 $ $ 2 No Bid
273 |WP
274 |QSC K12.2 Speakers 4 $ 91945(8$ 3,677.80 4 $ 758.84| $ 3,035.36 4 $ $ 4 $ 864.00 | $ 3,456.00
275 [QSC K12.S-Yoke 4 $ 155.65| $ 622.60 4 $ 128.79 | $ 515.16 4 $ $ 4 $ 147.00 [ $ 588.00
276 |QSC K8.2 Speakers 4 $ 73438 ($ 2,937.52 4 $ 606.06 | $§ 2,424.24 4 $ $ 4 $ 689.00 | $ 2,756.00
277 |QSC K8.S-Yoke 4 $ 137.70 | $ 550.80 4 $ 113.64| $ 454.56 4 $ $ 4 $ 129.00 [ $ 516.00
Microphone Stand with
Quarter-Turn Clutch and 4 No bid 4 $ 4999 $ 199.96 4 $ $ 4 No Bid
278 |[Stackable Base
Gator Rackworks rack
drawer; 14.2" deep; 2 $ 146.87 | $ 293.74 2 $ 131.99( $ 263.98 2 $ $ 2 $ 164.00 | $ 328.00
279 |Lockable; 2U
Gator Rackworks Rack
Drawer; 14.2" deep
Lockable; Interior has 2 No Bid 2 No Bid 2 $ $ 2 No Bid
insert for 4 wireless
Microphone Systems &
280 |Accessories; 3RU
Listen
TechnologiesStationary RF .
Transmitter W/DANTE 1 No Bid 1 $ 853.14| $ 853.14 1 $ $ 1 $ 976.00 | $ 976.00
281 |(216 MHz)
Universal Rack Mounting 1 No Bid 1 $ 60548  60.54 1 $ $ 1 $ 70.00 | $ 70.00
282 |Kit
Universal Antenna Kit (72 .
283 |MHz and 216 MHz) 1 No Bid 1 $ 96.94 | $ 96.94 1 $ $ 1 $ 117.00 | $ 117.00
Advanced Intelligent DSP .
284 |RF Receiver (216 MHz) 12 No Bid 12 $ 194.25| $ 2,331.00 12 $ $ 12 $ 221.00( $ 2,652.00
Intelligent Earphone/Neck 12 No Bid 12 $ 5034 S  604.08 12 S S 12 $ 5800|8 69600
285 [Loop Lanyard
286 |Universal Ear Speaker 12 No Bid 12 $ 1534 8§  184.08 12 $ $ 12 $ 19.00 | $ 228.00
16 Updated 3/15/2024
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287

IRWINE UM IFIEID
SCHOOL DISTRICT

Intelligent 12-Unit
Charging Tray

No Bid

THEATER BLACK BOX EQUIPMENT AND RELATED SUPPLIES
BID AWARD MATRIX

RID OPE

ING y12/24 3

t1-00 PM

1

$ 321.81

$

321.81

375.00

375.00

288

Intelligent Cable
Management Unit

No Bid

$ 40.76

$

40.76

*L

44.00

&+

44.00

289

USB to Micro USB Cable

No Bid

$ 5.52

$

5.52

i<el

6.00

&+

6.00

290

Assistive Listening
Notification Signage Kit

No Bid

No Bid

22.00

22.00

291

EH Series 3.5MM, 3
Conductor Jack To Solder
Contacts - Black Finish

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

292

Pair of professional "Phono
Plug’ (RCA'- or 'CINCH -
type) - marked red and
black.

10

22.68

$

226.80

10

No Bid

10

10

No Bid

293

3 pole male receptacle, D-
size metal body, screw
terminals accommodating
wire range 0.14mm? to
0.5mm? (AWG 26 -20),
black metal housing, gold
contacts, UL recognized
component

25

No bid

25

No Bid

25

25

No Bid

294

3 pole female receptacle, D-
size metal body, screw
terminals accommodating
wire range 0.14mm? to
0.5mm? (AWG 26 -20),
black metal housing, gold
contacts, UL recognized
component

25

No bid

25

No Bid

25

25

No Bid

295

3 pole female cable
connector with Nickel
housing and silver contacts.

25

4.40

$

110.00

25

No Bid

25

25

No Bid

296

3 pole male cable connector
with Nickel housing and
silver contacts.

25

4.03

$

100.75

25

No Bid

25

25

No Bid

297

PODIUM FLANGE
MOUNT-BLACK

11.63

$

23.26

$ 10.99

$

21.98

No Bid

298

6 INCH GOOSENECK -
BLACK

No bid

No Bid

No Bid
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IRWINE UM IFIEID
SCHOOL DISTRICT

THEATER BLACK BOX EQUIPMENT AND RELATED SUPPLIES

BID AWARD MATRIX

BID OPENING 3/12/24 at 1:00 PM

HOSA PRO STEREO

INTERCONNECT; REAN 7.85 15.70 2 No Bid No Bid
299 3.5MM-3.5MM 5

HOSA PRO STEREO

INTERCONNECT; REAN 6.05 12.10 2 No Bid No Bid
300 3.5MM-3.5MM 15

High Speed HDMI Cable . .
301 |with Ethernet 3' 5.81 17.43 3 No Bid No Bid

High Speed HDMI Cable . .
302 |with Ethernet 6' 6.98 34.90 5 No Bid No Bid

High Speed HDMI Cable . .
303 |with Ethernet 25' 21.80 65.40 3 No Bid No Bid

Belden 9451-Black No Bid 3 No Bid No Bid
304

AJA SDI to HDMI No Bid 1 $ 402.38| $§  402.38 No Bid

Converter
305

Canare cable LC-4.5CHD-

PL RG6 3GSDI Plenum . . .

Rated Cable=1000 feet NoBid ! NoBid NoBid
306 |(305M) Black
307 Network Switch No Bid 1 No Bid No Bid

Network Switch power cord No Bid 1 No Bid No Bid

308
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