
Manufacturer:  Beverage-Air
Item # Description Model # % Catalog Discount Lead Time (weeks) % Catalog Discount Lead Time (weeks) % Catalog Discount Lead Time (weeks) % Catalog Discount Lead Time (weeks) % Catalog Discount Lead Time (weeks)

1 Stainless steel milk cooler, cold wall All models 70.00% 4-6 weeks No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 22.00% 4 weeks 57.00% 3-4 weeks
2 Stainless steel milk cooler, forced air All models 70.00% 4-6 weeks No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 22.00% 4 weeks 57.00% 3-4 weeks

3

Manufacturer:  Blodgett
Item # Description Model # % Catalog Discount Lead Time (weeks) % Catalog Discount Lead Time (weeks) % Catalog Discount Lead Time (weeks) % Catalog Discount Lead Time (weeks) % Catalog Discount Lead Time (weeks)

4
Dual flow gas convection bakery oven, double 
compartment

DFG-200-ES DBL 60.00% 3-4 weeks No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 32.00% 1 week 55.00% 3-4 weeks

5 Full size bakery depth electric convection oven ZEPH-200-E-DBL 70.00% 3-4 weeks No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 32.00% 1 week 55.00% 3-4 weeks

6

Manufacturer:  Cambro
Item # Description Model # % Catalog Discount Lead Time (weeks) % Catalog Discount Lead Time (weeks) % Catalog Discount Lead Time (weeks) % Catalog Discount Lead Time (weeks) % Catalog Discount Lead Time (weeks)

7 Dunnage rack All models 35.00% 2-3 weeks No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 40.00% 1 week 50.00% 3-4 weeks
8 Shelving All models 30.00% 2-3 weeks No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 40.00% 4 weeks 50.00% 3-4 weeks
9 Vending cart All models 50.00% 2-3 weeks 40.00% 2 weeks 50.00% 3-4 weeks

10

Manufacturer:  Cres Cor
Item # Description Model # % Catalog Discount Lead Time (weeks) % Catalog Discount Lead Time (weeks) % Catalog Discount Lead Time (weeks) % Catalog Discount Lead Time (weeks) % Catalog Discount Lead Time (weeks)

11 Insulated stainless steel hot cabinet, two door H-137-SUA-12D 50.90% 6-8 weeks No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 42.00% 6-8 weeks 52.50% 3-4 weeks

12
Quicktherm rethermalization cart, 208 volt, 8000 
watts, single phase

RO-151-FUA-18DE 50.00% 6-8 weeks No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 42.00% 6-8 weeks 52.50% 3-4 weeks

13

Manufacturer:  G.A. Systems, Inc.
Item # Description Model # % Catalog Discount Lead Time (weeks) % Catalog Discount Lead Time (weeks) % Catalog Discount Lead Time (weeks) % Catalog Discount Lead Time (weeks) % Catalog Discount Lead Time (weeks)

14 Basket dolly LY8 40.00% 26+ weeks No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 45.00% 26 weeks No Bid No Bid
15 Cashier stand All models 51.50% 26+ weeks No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 45.00% 26 weeks No Bid No Bid
16 Freezer cabinet All models 51.50% 26+ weeks No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 45.00% 26 weeks No Bid No Bid
17 Heated speedline cabinet All models 51.50% 26+ weeks No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 45.00% 26 weeks No Bid No Bid
18 Merchandising cabinet All models 51.50% 26+ weeks No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 45.00% 26 weeks No Bid No Bid
19 Merchandising rack All models 51.50% 26+ weeks No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 45.00% 26 weeks No Bid No Bid
20 Refrigerated speedline cabinet All models 51.50% 26+ weeks No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 45.00% 26 weeks No Bid No Bid
21 Speedline lid storage cart LC30 51.50% 26+ weeks No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 45.00% 26 weeks No Bid No Bid
22 Stainless steel standard wire basket All models 40.00% 26+ weeks No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 45.00% 26 weeks No Bid No Bid

23

Irvine Unified School District
Bid No. 25/26-02NS, Kitchen Equipment

Bid Results Matrix
Bids Due: Wednesday, October 15, 2025 @ 1:30pm

___57.00____ % Catalog Discount

___55.00____ % Catalog Discount

___50.00____ % Catalog Discount

___52.50____ % Catalog Discount

___No Bid____ % Catalog Discount

___No Bid____ % Catalog Discount

___No Bid____ % Catalog Discount

___No Bid____ % Catalog Discount ___No Bid____ % Catalog Discount

Cambro:  Other Non-Specified Items ___49.00____ % Catalog Discount

Cres Cor:  Other Non-Specified Items ___50.00____ % Catalog Discount

___No Bid____ % Catalog Discount

___No Bid____ % Catalog Discount

___No Bid____ % Catalog Discount

Bidder:  
Oliver Packaging and Equipment

Bidder:  
The Platinum Packaging Group, 
Inc.

Bidder:  
Premier Culinary Solutions, Inc.

___40.00____ % Catalog Discount

___42.00____ % Catalog Discount

___45.00____ % Catalog Discount

___70.00____ % Catalog Discount

___50.00____ % Catalog Discount ___No Bid____ % Catalog Discount

Bidder:  
Sam Tell and Son

Beverage-Air:  Other Non-Specified Items

Blodgett:  Other Non-Specified Items

___22.00____ % Catalog Discount

___32.00____ % Catalog Discount

G.A. Systems, Inc.:  Other Non-Specified Items ____49.00____ % Catalog Discount

___No Bid____ % Catalog Discount

___No Bid____ % Catalog Discount

___No Bid____ % Catalog Discount

___No Bid____ % Catalog Discount

Bidder:  
Arrow Restaurant Equipment and 
Supply, Inc.
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Manufacturer:  Oliver Packaging

24

Manufacturer:  Panasonic
Item # Description Model # % Catalog Discount Lead Time (weeks) % Catalog Discount Lead Time (weeks) % Catalog Discount Lead Time (weeks) % Catalog Discount Lead Time (weeks) % Catalog Discount Lead Time (weeks)

25
Commercial microwave oven with sonic steamer, 
3200 watt

NE-3280 58.00% 2-4 weeks No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 40.00% 1 week 45.00% 3-4 weeks

26

Manufacturer: Platinum Packaging Group
Item # Description Model # % Catalog Discount Lead Time (weeks) % Catalog Discount Lead Time (weeks) % Catalog Discount Lead Time (weeks) % Catalog Discount Lead Time (weeks) % Catalog Discount Lead Time (weeks)

27 Horizontal Flow Wrapper Model H90M No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 4.00% 15-16 weeks 0.00% 16 week No Bid No Bid
28 Vertical Form Fill and Seal Machine VB Bagger 775 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5.00% 14-15 weeks 0.00% 16 week No Bid No Bid

29

Manufacturer: Rational
Item # Description Model # % Catalog Discount Lead Time (weeks) % Catalog Discount Lead Time (weeks) % Catalog Discount Lead Time (weeks) % Catalog Discount Lead Time (weeks) % Catalog Discount Lead Time (weeks)

30

Item # Description Model # % Catalog Discount Lead Time (weeks) % Catalog Discount Lead Time (weeks) % Catalog Discount Lead Time (weeks) % Catalog Discount Lead Time (weeks) % Catalog Discount Lead Time (weeks)

31
Reach-in solid swing door freezer, stainless steel, 
two-door, with hydrocarbon refrigerant

STA2F-2S-HC 72.93% 6-8 weeks No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 25.00% 5-6 weeks 65.00% 3-4 weeks

32
Reach-in solid swing door freezer, stainless steel, 
one-door, with hydrocarbon refrigerant

STA1F-1S-HC 72.93% 6-8 weeks No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 25.00% 5-6 weeks 65.00% 3-4 weeks

33
Reach-in sold swing door refrigerator, stainless 
steel, one-door, with hydrocarbon refrigerant

STA1R-1S-HC 72.93% 6-8 weeks No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 25.00% 5-6 weeks 65.00% 3-4 weeks

34
Reach-in solid swing door refrigerator, stainless 
steel, two-door, with hydrocarbon refrigerant

STA2R-2S-HC 72.93% 6-8 weeks No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 25.00% 5-6 weeks 65.00% 3-4 weeks

35

___45.00_____ % Catalog Discount

__No Bid___ % Catalog Discount__No Bid___ % Catalog Discount

___No Bid____ % Catalog Discount___No Bid____ % Catalog Discount

____48.00_____ % Catalog Discount ___30.00_____ % Catalog Discount

___65.00____ % Catalog Discount

Please Note:  Bid prices are to include shipping, F.O.B. Irvine Unified School District, uncrating, assembly, inside delivery, and install/set in place.   Bidder will not be required to address any utility connections, nor will they be required to install infrastructure, such as gas 
lines, electricity, or drainage. District will handle hook-ups to District’s utilities (electrical, gas, water) and drainage when required by equipment.

____3.00____ % Catalog Discount

___No Bid____ % Catalog Discount

___No Bid____ % Catalog Discount

___No Bid____ % Catalog Discount

___No Bid____ % Catalog Discount

___No Bid____ % Catalog DiscountTrue Manufacturing:  Other Non-Specified Items ___72.93____ % Catalog Discount

____0.00______ % Catalog Discount

Rational:  All Non-Specified Items ___30.00_____ % Catalog Discount

Manufacturer:  True Manufacturing

___No Bid____ % Catalog Discount

____20.00____ % Catalog Discount

Bidder:  
Sam Tell and Son

___25.00____ % Catalog Discount

____10.00____ % Catalog Discount

___40.00_____ % Catalog DiscountPanasonic: Other Non-Specified Items __57.50____ % Catalog Discount

Platinum Packaging Group:  Other Non-Specified Items ___No Bid____ % Catalog Discount

Oliver Packaging:  All Non-Specified Items __No Bid___ % Catalog Discount

Bidder:  
Arrow Restaurant Equipment and 
Supply, Inc.

Bidder:  
Oliver Packaging and Equipment

Bidder:  
The Platinum Packaging Group, 
Inc.

Bidder:  
Premier Culinary Solutions, Inc.

Irvine Unified School District
Bid No. 25/26-02NS, Kitchen Equipment

Bids Due: Wednesday, October 15, 2025 @ 1:30pm
Bid Results Matrix
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	(5) Bids

